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Soyadı D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N

1 ÇAĞLA KUDU 14 1 13,66 15 0 15,00 15 0 15,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 71 4 69,64 200,620 ASİL KAYIT
2 ASYA ZİYANSIZ 13 2 12,33 15 0 15,00 15 0 15,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 70 5 68,32 195,310 ASİL KAYIT
3 ELA TANEM TEMUR 13 2 12,33 13 2 12,33 15 0 15,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 66 9 62,98 181,960 ASİL KAYIT
4 İBRAHİM ÖMER TÜFEKÇİ 10 5 8,33 15 0 15,00 15 0 15,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 66 9 62,99 177,980 ASİL KAYIT
5 EMİR SALİH ÖZTÜRK 11 4 9,66 14 1 13,66 15 0 15,00 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 64 11 60,31 175,270 ASİL KAYIT
6 TUĞBA KABASAKAL 12 2 11,33 12 2 11,33 14 1 13,66 8 1 7,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 65 7 62,64 171,600 ASİL KAYIT
7 N.BETÜL DEMİRCİOĞLU 13 2 12,33 14 1 13,66 13 2 12,33 6 4 4,66 5 4 3,66 9 0 9,00 60 13 55,64 170,600 ASİL KAYIT
8 KEREM TETİK 13 2 12,33 11 4 9,66 15 0 15,00 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 63 12 58,98 169,950 ASİL KAYIT
9 KIVANÇ ÖZKAN 15 0 15,00 10 5 8,33 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 64 11 60,32 167,300

10 FURKAN UZUNOĞLU 10 4 8,66 12 3 11,00 15 0 15,00 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 66 8 63,32 167,300

11 MUHARREM KEREM KOÇ 12 3 11,00 13 2 12,33 14 1 13,66 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 10 0 10,00 60 15 54,98 165,950

12 NEHİR AKKAŞ 10 5 8,33 14 0 14,00 14 1 13,66 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 9 0 9,00 59 14 54,31 162,280

13 ZEYNEP ATICI 11 3 10,00 12 2 11,33 15 0 15,00 5 4 3,66 4 5 2,33 10 0 10,00 57 14 52,32 161,310

14 OSMAN METİN UYAR 11 4 9,66 13 2 12,33 14 1 13,66 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 10 0 10,00 59 16 53,65 160,600

15 SULTAN SEÇKİN 11 4 9,66 13 2 12,33 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 6 3 5,00 10 0 10,00 61 13 56,65 159,610

16 MEHMET EGE YAMAN 11 4 9,66 13 2 12,33 13 2 12,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 10 0 10,00 58 17 52,31 155,270

17 GÜLSERİ ELA ÖZTÜRK 12 3 11,00 11 4 9,66 14 1 13,66 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 10 0 10,00 58 17 52,31 155,270

18 MEHMET EFE GÜLŞEN 12 2 11,33 13 2 12,33 13 2 12,33 4 6 2,00 3 5 1,33 7 0 7,00 52 17 46,32 154,290

19 AYŞE MELİSA YILMAZ 11 4 9,66 12 1 11,66 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 9 1 8,66 58 15 52,97 153,920

20 MUHAMMED MUSTAFA GÜL 10 5 8,33 13 1 12,66 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 10 0 10,00 58 16 52,65 152,610

21 YİĞİT EREN TIRAŞ 9 4 7,66 10 4 8,66 15 0 15,00 9 1 8,66 9 0 9,00 9 1 8,66 61 10 57,64 151,600

22 MİHRİBAN ERDOĞAN 9 6 7,00 13 2 12,33 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 61 14 56,31 151,290

23 MUHAMMED TALHA YILDI 9 4 7,66 14 1 13,66 12 1 11,66 6 3 5,00 4 6 2,00 10 0 10,00 55 15 49,98 148,920

24 MEHMET EFE YILDIZ 10 2 9,33 10 2 9,33 14 0 14,00 7 3 6,00 6 3 5,00 7 3 6,00 54 13 49,66 147,640

25 ÇAĞRI PAKAPAN 8 7 5,66 11 3 10,00 15 0 15,00 8 2 7,33 3 6 1,00 10 0 10,00 55 18 48,99 140,970

26 EDA ÇAKIR 10 5 8,33 11 3 10,00 14 1 13,66 5 4 3,66 3 7 0,66 9 1 8,66 52 21 44,97 140,940

27 ELİF ZEYNEP ESASPEHL 10 5 8,33 12 3 11,00 11 4 9,66 7 2 6,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 56 18 49,98 136,950

28 YAVUZ SELİM SUCU 7 8 4,33 14 1 13,66 12 3 11,00 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 10 0 10,00 54 21 46,98 133,950

29 ZEYNEP ÇETİN 7 7 4,66 11 3 10,00 13 1 12,66 8 2 7,33 5 3 4,00 10 0 10,00 54 16 48,65 130,610

30 MUHAMMET EMİR ÜNLÜ 10 5 8,33 9 6 7,00 13 1 12,66 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 9 1 8,66 52 22 44,64 128,610

31 ADEM YAVUZ ÇOBANTEPE 9 5 7,33 11 3 10,00 12 2 11,33 5 5 3,33 4 5 2,33 8 2 7,33 49 22 41,65 127,630

32 EYMEN ERGÜN 9 6 7,00 8 4 6,66 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 54 18 47,98 125,950

33 CEREN ASLAN 8 7 5,66 6 7 3,66 15 0 15,00 10 0 10,00 5 4 3,66 10 0 10,00 54 18 47,98 120,940

34 SERAP ÇOBANOĞLU 8 5 6,33 9 5 7,33 11 1 10,66 7 2 6,33 5 3 4,00 8 0 8,00 48 16 42,65 115,610

35 ŞEYMA ÖZZEYBEK 8 7 5,66 8 5 6,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 9 0 9,00 52 20 45,32 114,290

36 MUSTAFA ERAY GİRGİN 8 7 5,66 10 4 8,66 12 3 11,00 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 47 27 37,98 113,940

37 YUŞA MERT CÖMERT 11 4 9,66 7 7 4,66 11 3 10,00 7 3 6,00 3 6 1,00 9 1 8,66 48 24 39,98 112,940

38 EDA YÜKSEL 7 7 4,66 7 5 5,33 12 1 11,66 6 4 4,66 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 51 18 44,97 109,920

39 RÜZGAR PAŞA DEMİR 6 9 3,00 11 4 9,66 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 10 0 10,00 52 23 44,31 107,280

40 AMİNE GÜLTEKİN 10 3 9,00 10 4 8,66 10 5 8,33 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 31 12 26,99 104,960

41 EYMEN YUSUF ASLANCI 9 4 7,66 9 5 7,33 10 3 9,00 6 2 5,33 4 5 2,33 1 0 1,00 39 19 32,65 104,620

42 ŞEVKET EMİR KAHRAMAN 6 7 3,66 10 3 9,00 10 2 9,33 5 4 3,66 2 4 0,66 9 0 9,00 42 20 35,31 101,280

43 HÜSEYİN POLAT TAŞDAN 8 5 6,33 9 4 7,66 10 5 8,33 4 6 2,00 3 3 2,00 8 2 7,33 42 25 33,65 100,610

44 SEVDE KURŞUN 8 4 6,66 10 3 9,00 6 4 4,66 7 1 6,66 3 3 2,00 10 0 10,00 44 15 38,98 99,940

45 RÜYAM YÜKSEL 10 5 8,33 7 8 4,33 9 5 7,33 5 3 4,00 7 3 6,00 0 0 0,00 38 24 29,99 89,960

46 ARDA ÇINAR 6 8 3,33 6 9 3,00 10 4 8,66 5 4 3,66 3 7 0,66 8 1 7,66 38 33 26,97 71,940

47 SÜLEYMAN YİĞİT KAMAL 7 8 4,33 6 9 3,00 10 5 8,33 2 8 -0,66 2 8 -0,66 10 0 10,00 37 38 24,34 71,320

48 AYŞE NİL AKBABA 5 10 1,66 6 8 3,33 10 4 8,66 4 6 2,00 3 4 1,66 10 0 10,00 38 32 27,31 68,260

49 YAĞIZ ALP KAHYAOĞULL 2 7 -0,33 7 3 6,00 1 0 1,00 3 1 2,66 0 2 -0,66 1 3 0,00 14 16 8,67 28,680

50 ZEYNEP ÇAYLAK 3 8 0,33 2 6 0,00 6 2 5,33 3 3 2,00 0 7 -2,33 5 4 3,66 19 30 8,99 25,970

51 ASEL SARIÇAYIR 6 9 3,00 2 12 -2,00 4 10 0,66 5 5 3,33 3 5 1,33 8 2 7,33 28 43 13,65 18,630
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