
D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N
1 ENES ÇEVİRGEN 13 2 12,33 14 1 13,66 15 0 15,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 68 7 65,64 188,610 ASİL KAYIT
2 YUSUF KIZILIRMAK 13 1 12,66 15 0 15,00 11 2 10,33 10 0 10,00 9 0 9,00 6 2 5,33 64 5 62,32 176,290 ASİL KAYIT
3 POYRAZ ŞAHIN 12 2 11,33 13 0 13,00 14 1 13,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,66 64 8 61,31 175,280 ASİL KAYIT
4 YAVUZ SELİM AKTAŞ 14 1 13,66 12 1 11,66 12 2 11,33 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 67 5 65,31 175,260 ASİL KAYIT
5 ARYA ÇELİK 14 0 14,00 10 1 9,66 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 66 4 64,65 172,620 ASİL KAYIT
6 HILAL USLUKAN 14 1 13,66 12 2 11,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 66 8 63,32 171,290 ASİL KAYIT
7 YAĞIZ MEHMET BURCU 14 1 13,66 12 1 11,66 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 62 11 58,31 171,260 ASİL KAYIT
8 ARMIN ELA KAYA 12 2 11,33 14 1 13,66 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 63 11 59,32 167,290 ASİL KAYIT
9 DEFNE YILDIZ 14 1 13,66 9 2 8,33 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 63 8 60,31 163,270 ASİL KAYIT

10 YAĞMUR KAHRAMAN 11 1 10,66 12 0 12,00 12 1 11,66 8 1 7,66 8 1 7,66 9 1 8,66 60 5 58,30 161,260 ASİL KAYIT
11 ELIF GÖKÇE UŞAKLI 10 3 9,00 11 0 11,00 14 1 13,66 9 1 8,66 8 1 7,66 10 0 10,00 62 6 59,98 160,960 ASİL KAYIT
12 MUHAMMED KAPLAN 13 2 12,33 11 2 10,33 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 63 10 59,65 160,630 ASİL KAYIT
13 AHMET EREN YÜKSEL 15 0 15,00 10 3 9,00 13 2 12,33 9 0 9,00 2 6 0,00 7 3 6,00 56 14 51,33 160,320 ASİL KAYIT
14 İSMAIL KEREM KIRAN 13 2 12,33 11 3 10,00 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 7 1 6,66 6 4 4,66 60 12 55,98 159,960 ASİL KAYIT
15 TALHA GÜLER 12 3 11,00 11 3 10,00 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 61 13 56,65 156,640 ASİL KAYIT
16 RAŞIT YUSUF ÜRPER 11 2 10,33 11 2 10,33 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 61 10 57,65 156,620 ASİL KAYIT
17 MEHMET EMIR BAZ 12 2 11,33 9 1 8,66 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 62 7 59,65 156,610 ASİL KAYIT
18 BAHADIR YARAR 12 3 11,00 10 5 8,33 14 1 13,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 61 14 56,31 155,280 ASİL KAYIT
19 MUHAMMED ENES EBİLOĞ 13 2 12,33 12 2 11,33 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 60 14 55,30 155,260 ASİL KAYIT
20 METEHAN UZUN 12 3 11,00 11 1 10,66 13 2 12,33 6 3 5,00 7 1 6,66 7 2 6,33 56 12 51,98 153,950 ASİL KAYIT
21 ESRA UZUN 12 3 11,00 11 1 10,66 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 59 13 54,65 152,630 ASİL KAYIT
21 AZRA SAYINER 11 3 10,00 11 1 10,66 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 61 10 57,65 152,630 ASİL KAYIT
23 MIRAY GEZER 15 0 15,00 8 1 7,66 13 2 12,33 7 2 6,33 2 1 1,66 6 4 4,66 51 10 47,64 152,610 ASİL KAYIT
23 AYBIGE YIĞ 12 2 11,33 10 4 8,66 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 60 13 55,65 152,610 ASİL KAYIT
25 EYMEN EFE ERSÖZ 11 3 10,00 13 2 12,33 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 6 3 5,00 6 4 4,66 57 16 51,65 151,640 ASİL KAYIT
25 BERKEN KURT 12 3 11,00 11 2 10,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 8 1 7,66 8 2 7,33 59 13 54,65 151,640 ASİL KAYIT
27 DEFNE BEYAZTAŞ 10 5 8,33 12 1 11,66 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 62 11 58,31 151,280 ASİL KAYIT
28 RUKIYE İLBAY 11 4 9,66 11 4 9,66 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 60 15 54,97 149,920 ASİL KAYIT
29 ELİF NAZ BAŞARI 12 2 11,33 10 3 9,00 12 2 11,33 8 1 7,66 7 2 6,33 9 1 8,66 58 11 54,31 149,290 ASİL KAYIT
30 EYLÜL ŞİMŞEK 13 1 12,66 8 0 8,00 11 3 10,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 59 7 56,64 148,620 ASİL KAYIT
31 ÇAĞAN TOPALOĞLU 14 0 14,00 10 2 9,33 10 5 8,33 9 0 9,00 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 57 13 52,66 147,640 ASİL KAYIT
32 TOPRAK KORKUT BUDAK 14 1 13,66 9 2 8,33 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 7 0 7,00 0 0 0,00 51 7 48,65 147,620 ASİL KAYIT
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33 MUSTAFA ÇOLAKOĞLU 12 2 11,33 10 1 9,66 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 3 0 3,00 5 3 4,00 51 10 47,65 147,610 ASİL KAYIT
34 ESIN KUMLUBIÇAK 10 5 8,33 13 2 12,33 12 3 11,00 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 58 17 52,31 147,290 ASİL KAYIT
34 ARYA ULUÇTAN 13 2 12,33 9 5 7,33 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 60 14 55,31 147,290 ASİL KAYIT
36 İLKE KARATAY 14 0 14,00 7 1 6,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 59 8 56,31 147,270 ASİL KAYIT
37 NURETTIN KAAN KAPANC 12 2 11,33 11 1 10,66 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 10 0 10,00 57 14 52,31 147,260 ASİL KAYIT
38 BILGEN DURU GÖZEL 13 2 12,33 9 3 8,00 13 2 12,33 8 1 7,66 6 1 5,66 4 4 2,66 53 13 48,64 146,620 ASİL KAYIT
39 ÖYKÜ YAĞMUR YILDIRIM 9 2 8,33 12 0 12,00 11 3 10,00 8 1 7,66 9 1 8,66 8 1 7,66 57 8 54,31 145,300 ASİL KAYIT
40 MUZAFFER ENIS CAN 13 2 12,33 9 4 7,66 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 5 3 4,00 9 1 8,66 57 14 52,31 145,280 ASİL KAYIT
41 TOPRAK ARAS AKÇIT 12 3 11,00 9 2 8,33 11 3 10,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 9 0 9,00 60 9 56,99 144,980 ASİL KAYIT
42 ZEREN ŞAHİN 14 1 13,66 9 4 7,66 11 3 10,00 8 2 7,33 6 3 5,00 8 2 7,33 56 15 50,98 144,940 ASİL KAYIT
42 ELİF SENA ARSLAN 12 2 11,33 7 2 6,33 14 1 13,66 6 3 5,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 55 12 50,98 144,940 ASİL KAYIT
44 ARYA ERTEKIN 15 0 15,00 6 5 4,33 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 58 13 53,65 144,640 ASİL KAYIT
45 TUĞRA ŞEN 11 4 9,66 9 0 9,00 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 56 13 51,65 144,620 YEDEK
46 CEMRE KARADAĞ 11 4 9,66 9 5 7,33 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 61 13 56,64 144,600 YEDEK
46 ALI TURAN 10 4 8,66 10 2 9,33 14 1 13,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 55 16 49,65 144,600 YEDEK
48 ÖMER ASAF GÜN 13 2 12,33 10 2 9,33 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 2 1 1,66 54 11 50,31 144,270 YEDEK
49 ÖMER TOPARLI 12 3 11,00 9 4 7,66 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 9 0 9,00 59 13 54,66 143,640 YEDEK
50 MASAL ERÇEVIK 12 2 11,33 10 2 9,33 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 57 14 52,31 143,270 YEDEK
51 NIL KICIRLI 12 2 11,33 10 1 9,66 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 56 14 51,30 143,250 YEDEK
52 BARTU URUL 10 5 8,33 10 2 9,33 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 7 2 6,33 8 2 7,33 57 14 52,31 142,280 YEDEK
53 YIĞIT EGE ER 9 6 7,00 12 2 11,33 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 59 15 53,99 141,980 YEDEK
54 NAMIK ALP GELICI 10 3 9,00 10 2 9,33 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 58 12 53,98 141,970 YEDEK
55 ECESU KAYA 13 2 12,33 8 5 6,33 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 58 15 52,98 141,960 YEDEK
56 MUSTAFA KILIÇ 10 4 8,66 11 3 10,00 12 3 11,00 7 1 6,66 9 1 8,66 8 1 7,66 57 13 52,64 141,620 YEDEK
57 HELEN NIL ÖZBEK 12 2 11,33 9 4 7,66 13 2 12,33 5 4 3,66 8 2 7,33 6 3 5,00 53 17 47,31 141,270 YEDEK
58 HALIL IBRAHIM ÜNLÜ 12 3 11,00 6 2 5,33 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 9 0 9,00 58 9 54,99 140,970 YEDEK
59 BUĞLEM ÖZERIN 11 3 10,00 10 3 9,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 56 16 50,66 140,660 YEDEK
60 ALI OSMAN ŞENGÜL 11 4 9,66 8 7 5,66 14 1 13,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 59 16 53,63 140,570 YEDEK
61 FATMA ZEHRA BİKLİÇ 11 2 10,33 9 2 8,33 13 2 12,33 8 1 7,66 0 0 0,00 9 1 8,66 50 8 47,31 140,280 YEDEK
62 OSMAN VURAL 11 4 9,66 9 6 7,00 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,66 58 17 52,31 139,280 YEDEK
63 FURKAN BARI 11 3 10,00 11 2 10,33 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 0 0 0,00 52 10 48,65 138,620 YEDEK
64 HIRA NUR KOCUNMA 12 1 11,66 8 2 7,33 11 4 9,66 9 0 9,00 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 56 11 52,31 138,260 YEDEK
65 SALIH GÜLCÜ 9 4 7,66 8 2 7,33 14 1 13,66 10 0 10,00 7 2 6,33 7 3 6,00 55 12 50,98 136,930

66 METE YALÇIN 12 3 11,00 11 3 10,00 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 55 19 48,66 136,650

67 HASAN ÇAKIR 10 5 8,33 10 3 9,00 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 54 19 47,65 136,630

68 EFTALNUR ÇELİK 12 2 11,33 6 4 4,66 13 2 12,33 6 3 5,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 55 13 50,64 135,600

69 ASYA AKTAŞ 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,66 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 55 20 48,32 135,290

70 GÖKÇE YIKILMAZ 12 2 11,33 8 3 7,00 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 56 14 51,31 135,280



71 AYŞE ECE AVCI 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 53 17 47,31 135,270

72 AHMET ŞERBETÇIOĞLU 12 2 11,33 10 2 9,33 11 4 9,66 5 4 3,66 4 4 2,66 8 1 7,66 50 17 44,30 135,260

73 YAREN ÖZDEN 9 5 7,33 10 2 9,33 13 2 12,33 8 0 8,00 7 0 7,00 5 3 4,00 52 12 47,99 134,960

74 KARYA GÜNEŞ 11 1 10,66 7 2 6,33 11 2 10,33 10 0 10,00 9 0 9,00 7 3 6,00 55 8 52,32 134,280

74 HILAL TUĞSEM İKİZ 12 3 11,00 7 4 5,66 12 2 11,33 9 1 8,66 6 3 5,00 9 1 8,66 55 14 50,31 134,280

76 KÜBRA GÜDÜCÜ 13 2 12,33 7 6 5,00 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 58 15 52,98 133,950

77 ALPEREN DAĞ 12 3 11,00 8 5 6,33 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 58 15 52,97 133,940

78 YAĞMUR ÖNER 11 4 9,66 9 2 8,33 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,66 56 15 50,97 133,920

79 GÖKÇE KARAKUYU 11 3 10,00 8 2 7,33 11 3 10,00 7 1 6,66 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 55 11 51,32 133,310

80 BAŞAK GÖÇ 10 5 8,33 6 5 4,33 15 0 15,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 7 1 6,66 55 14 50,31 133,290

81 ECE NAZ İNANDIK 12 3 11,00 7 6 5,00 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 54 19 47,65 132,640

82 ALI YAZICI 8 6 6,00 9 2 8,33 13 2 12,33 8 1 7,66 10 0 10,00 8 1 7,66 56 12 51,98 131,960

83 ZEYNEP ASYA KARİP 12 2 11,33 7 2 6,33 11 3 10,00 8 0 8,00 7 1 6,66 7 3 6,00 52 11 48,32 131,300

84 ZÜMRA HAZEL GÜDÜCÜ 13 2 12,33 8 5 6,33 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 56 17 50,31 131,280

84 BUĞLEM ERMİŞ 11 2 10,33 8 3 7,00 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 55 14 50,31 131,280

86 MERT GÖRGÜLÜ 10 3 9,00 10 2 9,33 11 4 9,66 7 1 6,66 9 1 8,66 5 4 3,66 52 15 46,97 130,940

87 ELA OKTAY 13 2 12,33 6 3 5,00 11 4 9,66 8 1 7,66 10 0 10,00 6 3 5,00 54 13 49,65 130,620

88 ELIF DALLIK 11 4 9,66 6 3 5,00 12 3 11,00 9 0 9,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 57 11 53,32 130,300

89 İKRA BALCI 10 5 8,33 10 2 9,33 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 8 1 7,66 54 17 48,31 130,270

90 ALI DENIZ KÖSE 10 5 8,33 7 6 5,00 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 58 15 52,98 129,960

91 MEYRA SARIOĞLU 10 2 9,33 9 1 8,66 10 3 9,00 7 2 6,33 8 1 7,66 8 0 8,00 52 9 48,98 129,950

92 ÖMER FARUK ÜNLÜ 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,66 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 57 18 50,97 129,930

93 MUHAMMED KAYRA YAVUZ 12 2 11,33 8 3 7,00 12 3 11,00 6 2 5,33 4 4 2,66 5 4 3,66 47 18 40,98 128,970

94 YAĞIZ DUMAN 12 3 11,00 7 4 5,66 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 9 0 9,00 55 15 49,98 128,940

95 HIRASU GÜÇ 13 2 12,33 5 10 1,66 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 56 19 49,64 128,600

96 RAMAZAN CAN 10 5 8,33 9 3 8,00 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 6 2 5,33 8 2 7,33 52 18 45,99 127,980

97 EGE FILIZ 11 1 10,66 5 6 3,00 14 1 13,66 6 3 5,00 10 0 10,00 4 2 3,33 50 13 45,65 127,610

98 ELANUR KAYA 12 3 11,00 9 4 7,66 10 5 8,33 10 0 10,00 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 53 20 46,32 127,290

99 MUSTAFA EGE YILDIZOĞ 10 5 8,33 5 6 3,00 14 1 13,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 57 14 52,31 127,280

100 KAAN TAŞKENT 10 5 8,33 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 55 20 48,31 127,270

101 EYLÜL ADA EŞFER 14 1 13,66 6 4 4,66 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 53 17 47,31 127,260

102 NISANUR KAYA 12 3 11,00 6 5 4,33 11 3 10,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 55 15 49,98 125,970

103 BEYZA AKKUL 11 3 10,00 7 2 6,33 11 3 10,00 5 1 4,66 9 1 8,66 7 0 7,00 50 10 46,65 125,640

104 GÖKÇE NUR ECİRLİ 12 3 11,00 6 5 4,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 7 2 6,33 7 3 6,00 52 18 45,99 124,980

105 AHMED KEREM BALCI 13 1 12,66 5 5 3,33 11 4 9,66 8 1 7,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 53 15 47,97 124,920

106 NEVA DINÇ 12 3 11,00 6 9 3,00 13 2 12,33 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 53 22 45,65 124,640

107 POYRAZ ŞİŞMANLAR 9 6 7,00 11 4 9,66 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 50 25 41,65 124,630

108 NECATI KAYA 10 4 8,66 10 2 9,33 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 52 19 45,65 124,610



108 AYKUT EYMEN ACUN 11 4 9,66 7 8 4,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 56 19 49,64 124,610

110 YUSUF EMIR ULU 13 2 12,33 8 7 5,66 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 53 22 45,64 124,600

110 EYLÜL KEMER 10 5 8,33 10 1 9,66 9 5 7,33 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 54 16 48,64 124,600

112 RAZIYE NUR ÜZGÜN 12 2 11,33 6 2 5,33 11 4 9,66 7 2 6,33 6 2 5,33 8 2 7,33 50 14 45,31 124,270

113 BUĞRA ÜLKÜ 10 4 8,66 8 3 7,00 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 7 1 6,66 4 6 2,00 50 18 43,98 123,960

114 ARIN GEZER 12 2 11,33 8 4 6,66 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 7 2 6,33 7 3 6,00 51 19 44,65 123,610

115 DERIN CANER 12 3 11,00 5 7 2,66 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 52 20 45,31 123,280

116 GÜNEŞ DILA TOZ 13 1 12,66 4 3 3,00 11 2 10,33 8 2 7,33 6 1 5,66 7 3 6,00 49 12 44,98 122,950

117 ASYA AYKURT 13 1 12,66 4 6 2,00 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 8 0 8,00 7 3 6,00 51 16 45,66 122,640

118 EMRE AVCI 12 2 11,33 8 3 7,00 10 4 8,66 10 0 10,00 3 1 2,66 3 3 2,00 46 13 41,65 122,620

119 SEZAI DÖNMEZ 11 4 9,66 9 4 7,66 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 7 1 6,66 52 19 45,64 122,590

120 ELA SARITAŞ 11 3 10,00 9 2 8,33 9 3 8,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 6 3 5,00 49 17 43,32 122,310

121 ZİYA İŞSENİN 9 4 7,66 10 2 9,33 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 52 18 45,97 121,930

122 ZEYNEP DÜLGER 10 4 8,66 6 7 3,66 13 2 12,33 7 1 6,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 53 17 47,30 121,250

123 ELİF SU MANDACI 11 4 9,66 6 6 4,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 7 2 6,33 53 18 46,98 120,960

124 ASLI ÖZ 10 5 8,33 9 4 7,66 11 4 9,66 6 3 5,00 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 51 21 43,97 120,920

125 MUSTAFA DEMIR 10 3 9,00 5 6 3,00 12 1 11,66 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 54 13 49,65 120,630

126 ENSAR DEMİR 12 3 11,00 6 7 3,66 13 2 12,33 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 48 25 39,65 120,620

126 ELIF NISA KOZAK 10 5 8,33 10 2 9,33 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 53 19 46,64 120,620

128 MERVE AZRA ÖZCAN 11 4 9,66 8 5 6,33 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 51 22 43,65 120,600

129 DURU ÖZBEK 11 4 9,66 8 7 5,66 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,66 53 22 45,64 120,580

130 MEHMET TÜRKMEN 10 4 8,66 10 2 9,33 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 9 0 9,00 51 19 44,65 119,620

131 KAAN ALKAN 10 4 8,66 9 4 7,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 6 3 5,00 49 22 41,64 119,580

132 BATU ASAF DEMIRTAŞ 10 5 8,33 6 3 5,00 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 52 17 46,31 119,300

133 BEREN ELMAS 13 2 12,33 5 5 3,33 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 50 20 43,31 119,270

134 AYŞE SEVINÇ 10 3 9,00 7 4 5,66 11 4 9,66 6 3 5,00 8 1 7,66 9 1 8,66 51 16 45,64 118,600

135 BEREN YAVUZ 9 3 8,00 5 0 5,00 12 1 11,66 6 2 5,33 9 0 9,00 6 2 5,33 47 8 44,32 118,300

136 MERYEM ASYA KARAHAN 11 3 10,00 7 4 5,66 13 2 12,33 7 2 6,33 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 38 11 34,32 118,290

137 HAKAN KERAMİ BÖLÜKOĞ 13 2 12,33 4 8 1,33 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 51 21 43,98 117,960

138 METEHAN KIZMAZ 12 3 11,00 8 7 5,66 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 51 24 42,97 117,940

139 ADEM TALHA KUŞLAR 8 5 6,33 10 2 9,33 11 4 9,66 7 0 7,00 4 0 4,00 6 2 5,33 46 13 41,65 117,610

140 AYŞEGÜL BOZKURT 9 5 7,33 9 3 8,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 1 7 -1,33 7 3 6,00 46 23 38,33 117,320

141 ALYA TATLI 11 3 10,00 9 3 8,00 11 4 9,66 8 1 7,66 0 3 -1,00 0 0 0,00 39 14 34,32 117,300

142 MERYEM ÇOLAK 8 6 6,00 7 1 6,66 12 3 11,00 7 2 6,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 51 15 45,98 116,960

142 EYMEN SERİN 10 4 8,66 9 3 8,00 9 6 7,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 7 2 6,33 52 18 45,98 116,960

144 ELIF PULAT 11 3 10,00 7 1 6,66 11 4 9,66 6 3 5,00 2 0 2,00 6 4 4,66 43 15 37,98 116,940

145 YİĞİT GİRGİN 9 6 7,00 9 6 7,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 50 25 41,65 116,650

146 MERYEM DEMIRCI 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 7 8 4,33 8 1 7,66 6 1 5,66 8 2 7,33 50 16 44,64 116,610



147 YUNUS DOĞAN 9 4 7,66 8 4 6,66 12 3 11,00 8 1 7,66 4 0 4,00 5 4 3,66 46 16 40,64 116,600

148 BÜŞRA ALACA 9 6 7,00 9 6 7,00 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 52 23 44,31 115,290

149 BETÜL ÜNAL 11 4 9,66 10 5 8,33 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 52 23 44,30 115,250

150 ELİF DEMİRCİ 7 7 4,66 9 4 7,66 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 6 3 5,00 6 4 4,66 48 23 40,31 114,260

151 ALBINA AKYÜZ 8 6 6,00 7 5 5,33 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 53 18 46,98 113,970

152 HANZADE GEYİKLİ 9 6 7,00 5 4 3,66 13 2 12,33 8 1 7,66 7 3 6,00 8 0 8,00 50 16 44,65 113,620

153 YUSUF ATEŞ POLAT 10 5 8,33 7 5 5,33 11 4 9,66 8 1 7,66 8 2 7,33 6 3 5,00 50 20 43,31 113,270

154 ÇINAR SAĞ 8 7 5,66 7 4 5,66 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 7 2 6,33 6 4 4,66 49 21 41,97 112,920

155 ÖMER MEHMET KORKMAZ 11 4 9,66 11 3 10,00 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 46 28 36,65 112,610

156 ZEYNEP ZEREN KARAKUŞ 5 8 2,33 9 3 8,00 14 1 13,66 6 3 5,00 6 3 5,00 7 3 6,00 47 21 39,99 111,960

157 AYSIMA HACIOĞLU 9 5 7,33 9 4 7,66 11 3 10,00 5 5 3,33 4 4 2,66 7 3 6,00 45 24 36,98 111,950

158 ELÇIN AFIŞ 9 4 7,66 8 3 7,00 10 4 8,66 7 2 6,33 10 0 10,00 4 5 2,33 48 18 41,98 111,940

159 METEHAN DEMIR 11 4 9,66 8 3 7,00 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 4 1 3,66 44 22 36,64 111,610

160 ZEYNEP YILDIZ 10 3 9,00 5 3 4,00 11 2 10,33 7 2 6,33 7 0 7,00 6 4 4,66 46 14 41,32 111,310

161 ÇINAR ALP VEREP 9 3 8,00 7 4 5,66 10 3 9,00 8 2 7,33 8 0 8,00 6 2 5,33 48 14 43,32 111,300

162 MEHMET KENAN TURAN 9 4 7,66 7 4 5,66 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 52 17 46,31 111,260

162 ELIF ALYA KASIRGA 10 5 8,33 8 7 5,66 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 49 26 40,31 111,260

162 DENIZ ŞAHINER 13 2 12,33 6 4 4,66 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 6 4 4,66 44 26 35,30 111,260

165 DILARA ŞENGÜL 10 5 8,33 8 7 5,66 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 49 26 40,30 111,250

166 EYÜP ENSAR KULAKLI 10 5 8,33 8 3 7,00 10 4 8,66 7 3 6,00 4 4 2,66 7 3 6,00 46 22 38,65 110,620

167 ALI FIRAT KAYA 12 2 11,33 4 4 2,66 12 3 11,00 6 4 4,66 4 4 2,66 5 5 3,33 43 22 35,64 110,610

168 ALİ EYMEN EROĞLU 8 6 6,00 7 6 5,00 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 1 0 1,00 9 1 8,66 46 17 40,32 110,310

169 AYMIRA AKGÜN 9 6 7,00 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 4 5 2,33 3 7 0,66 45 29 35,31 110,280

170 MEHMET ALP ÖZENÇ 9 6 7,00 8 6 6,00 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 53 21 45,99 109,980

171 TANEM ÖZTÜRK 8 7 5,66 8 6 6,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 50 24 41,98 109,960

172 AZRA YAŞAR 14 1 13,66 5 7 2,66 9 6 7,00 4 6 2,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 48 24 39,98 109,940

172 AHMET ÇAĞAN KOÇOĞLU 10 5 8,33 7 4 5,66 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 50 21 42,98 109,940

174 AHMET ASIM İŞLEYİCİ 11 4 9,66 8 7 5,66 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 48 27 38,97 109,920

175 NURETTIN MIRAÇ KALMI 8 4 6,66 6 1 5,66 12 3 11,00 7 2 6,33 6 3 5,00 6 3 5,00 45 16 39,65 109,610

176 HASAN YILDIRIM 11 4 9,66 6 9 3,00 12 3 11,00 6 4 4,66 4 5 2,33 8 2 7,33 47 27 37,98 108,960

177 EYLÜL ÇELIK 10 4 8,66 6 3 5,00 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 8 1 7,66 8 2 7,33 49 18 42,98 108,950

178 ZEYNEP ÜLGÜNER 11 4 9,66 6 5 4,33 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 7 2 6,33 49 21 41,97 108,930

179 ELANUR ERİK 8 6 6,00 6 2 5,33 13 2 12,33 7 2 6,33 3 2 2,33 6 2 5,33 43 16 37,65 108,630

180 ISA ÇINAR TERZI 9 5 7,33 8 5 6,33 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 50 22 42,65 108,620

180 ADEN TUANA TÖRÜN 13 2 12,33 5 4 3,66 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 47 22 39,65 108,620

182 ALİ GÖKTUĞ GÖNÜLLÜ 9 4 7,66 7 2 6,33 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 48 19 41,64 108,600

183 SENANUR ERBİL 12 3 11,00 5 4 3,66 9 5 7,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 5 3 4,00 48 18 41,98 107,950

184 MELİSA ÇALIK 11 3 10,00 8 3 7,00 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 50 20 43,32 107,310



185 EDA SU ŞİMŞEK 9 6 7,00 10 4 8,66 9 6 7,00 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 48 26 39,32 107,300

186 ZEHRA RABIA SAYIN 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 12 3 11,00 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 7 3 6,00 44 26 35,31 107,280

186 HİRA ŞENGÜL 9 5 7,33 5 5 3,33 14 1 13,66 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 2 8 -0,66 43 26 34,32 107,280

188 EMIR OFLAZ 10 4 8,66 4 4 2,66 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 9 0 9,00 3 3 2,00 45 17 39,32 106,280

189 ÇINAR KERES 8 7 5,66 10 4 8,66 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 7 2 6,33 6 4 4,66 47 26 38,30 106,250

190 ÖMER MURAT SÖĞÜT 9 6 7,00 7 6 5,00 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 49 24 40,98 105,960

191 EMIRKAN CIVLAN 11 3 10,00 4 2 3,33 11 4 9,66 4 3 3,00 7 1 6,66 5 2 4,33 42 15 36,98 105,950

192 BETÜL MALGAZ 10 5 8,33 7 8 4,33 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 48 27 38,98 105,940

193 URAZ ERGÜDER 9 5 7,33 9 4 7,66 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 45 27 35,97 105,930

193 MİRMUHAMMED ALİ SABU 10 5 8,33 4 11 0,33 14 1 13,66 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 48 27 38,97 105,930

193 ECRIN ŞAHPAZ 8 6 6,00 9 4 7,66 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 45 27 35,97 105,930

196 SARE ŞEN 11 1 10,66 2 2 1,33 11 3 10,00 6 2 5,33 7 2 6,33 6 3 5,00 43 13 38,65 104,620

196 ERVA SULTAN TOKAT 6 9 3,00 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 50 25 41,65 104,620

198 ÇAĞAN ALI SOYKAN 10 4 8,66 7 7 4,66 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 45 28 35,64 104,580

199 BATUHAN DENİZ ERGİT 10 5 8,33 6 9 3,00 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 7 2 6,33 49 25 40,65 103,620

200 AYBÜKE AKTAN 10 4 8,66 6 0 6,00 8 7 5,66 6 3 5,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 48 16 42,64 103,600

201 ELIF MERMEREL 11 4 9,66 6 5 4,33 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 45 26 36,31 103,270

202 YAVUZ SELIM KARAYEL 9 6 7,00 4 9 1,00 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 4 2 3,33 9 0 9,00 48 20 41,32 102,310

203 İKRA YEĞEN 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,66 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 7 2 6,33 6 4 4,66 46 23 38,31 102,270

204 TANEM İŞLEK 12 3 11,00 4 10 0,66 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 5 3 4,00 1 3 0,00 42 24 33,99 101,970

205 ÖMER MUSAP ÖZDEMIR 8 7 5,66 7 8 4,33 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 51 24 42,98 101,930

205 ASYA ÇELIK 10 4 8,66 7 8 4,33 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 2 8 -0,66 6 4 4,66 44 30 33,98 101,930

207 İLKE CAN 8 7 5,66 8 7 5,66 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 51 24 42,97 101,920

208 ELIS BUĞLEM YILDIZ 11 2 10,33 5 2 4,33 9 6 7,00 5 4 3,66 7 1 6,66 6 4 4,66 43 19 36,64 101,620

208 ELIF EBRAR KABAK 9 6 7,00 5 10 1,66 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 3 0 3,00 46 22 38,65 101,620

210 ELİF ERVA ÇAVDAR 10 3 9,00 5 4 3,66 9 6 7,00 10 0 10,00 5 3 4,00 9 1 8,66 48 17 42,32 101,300

211 YUSUF BAKİ 11 3 10,00 5 4 3,66 9 6 7,00 5 4 3,66 8 1 7,66 8 2 7,33 46 20 39,31 101,290

211 MEHMET ALI AYDIN 8 6 6,00 4 8 1,33 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 6 2 5,33 9 1 8,66 49 20 42,31 101,290

213 ERVA ŞEN 11 3 10,00 2 7 -0,33 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 7 2 6,33 9 1 8,66 49 18 42,98 100,970

214 CAFER DOĞAN 9 5 7,33 5 6 3,00 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 8 2 7,33 45 25 36,66 100,650

215 RAVZA GÜNE 13 2 12,33 9 6 7,00 5 9 2,00 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 8 2 7,33 46 28 36,65 100,640

215 DURU ADA ÇAKIR 9 6 7,00 5 8 2,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 48 25 39,65 100,640

217 YIĞIT ADA KURT 10 5 8,33 5 8 2,33 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 48 25 39,64 100,600

218 DAMLA ALTINDIŞ 11 3 10,00 7 2 6,33 8 6 6,00 6 3 5,00 2 4 0,66 6 3 5,00 40 21 32,99 99,980

219 SEZAİ ALPER OĞUZ 11 2 10,33 5 4 3,66 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 1 0 1,00 0 1 -0,33 34 15 28,98 99,930

220 MUHAMMED ENES AVCI 9 5 7,33 7 6 5,00 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 46 26 37,31 99,290

221 ELIF AZRA ULU 10 5 8,33 4 10 0,66 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 48 26 39,31 99,280

222 ALI KEMAL İŞELI 7 6 5,00 4 2 3,33 12 3 11,00 8 1 7,66 7 1 6,66 8 2 7,33 46 15 40,98 98,970



223 ALI ENSAR KOÇU 10 5 8,33 6 6 4,00 9 5 7,33 8 2 7,33 7 1 6,66 7 3 6,00 47 22 39,65 98,630

224 HATEM EFE BALTA 10 5 8,33 7 8 4,33 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 8 1 7,66 7 3 6,00 48 26 39,32 98,300

225 MUHAMMED GÖKTAŞ 12 3 11,00 2 8 -0,66 11 3 10,00 8 2 7,33 5 2 4,33 6 4 4,66 44 22 36,66 97,680

226 DENIZ YILDIRIM 8 6 6,00 6 4 4,66 10 5 8,33 7 1 6,66 9 1 8,66 7 2 6,33 47 19 40,64 97,610

227 YAĞIZ BİZNAK 8 6 6,00 5 6 3,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 45 25 36,66 96,660

228 ELA NUR GÜZEL 8 6 6,00 7 7 4,66 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 48 25 39,65 96,620

229 ELİF DİKİCİLER 10 5 8,33 4 8 1,33 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 8 1 7,66 6 4 4,66 46 25 37,64 95,600

230 FEYZA KOÇ 9 6 7,00 6 9 3,00 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 46 29 36,32 95,300

230 ÇINAR DEMİRCİ 10 5 8,33 6 9 3,00 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 46 29 36,32 95,300

232 SELEN NAZ GÖRÜR 7 5 5,33 7 2 6,33 10 5 8,33 5 4 3,66 3 4 1,66 10 0 10,00 42 20 35,31 95,280

232 OSMAN KEREM GÖKKAYA 9 6 7,00 7 8 4,33 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 7 3 6,00 43 32 32,31 95,280

234 ELA KARAÇOBAN 6 2 5,33 5 1 4,66 9 4 7,66 8 0 8,00 9 1 8,66 8 0 8,00 45 8 42,31 95,260

234 AYŞEGÜL KARAKOÇ 10 5 8,33 9 4 7,66 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 41 32 30,31 95,260

236 BELINAY SAĞIR 8 6 6,00 7 3 6,00 10 4 8,66 8 1 7,66 4 3 3,00 3 4 1,66 40 21 32,98 94,960

237 EYMEN KABASAKAL 6 8 3,33 5 2 4,33 13 2 12,33 5 5 3,33 4 4 2,66 9 1 8,66 42 22 34,64 94,610

238 ÖMER FARUK CİVELEK 10 4 8,66 4 5 2,33 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 4 5 2,33 8 2 7,33 44 23 36,31 94,270

238 CANSU YEĞEN 10 5 8,33 8 5 6,33 8 7 5,66 4 6 2,00 5 4 3,66 8 2 7,33 43 29 33,31 94,270

240 MÜNEVVER RANA YÜKSEL 8 5 6,33 5 3 4,00 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 7 3 6,00 42 24 33,99 93,960

240 MEHMET AKIF EVREN 10 5 8,33 4 6 2,00 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 46 24 37,98 93,960

242 ZÜMRA SUPHANDAĞLI 13 2 12,33 4 10 0,66 9 6 7,00 5 5 3,33 5 4 3,66 7 3 6,00 43 30 32,98 92,950

243 ÇAĞAN EGE İLERI 9 4 7,66 4 6 2,00 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 4 5 2,33 43 24 34,98 92,940

243 AHMET SELİM GÜLKİN 9 5 7,33 7 4 5,66 9 5 7,33 6 2 5,33 7 1 6,66 2 7 -0,33 40 24 31,98 92,940

245 ATILLA BERK KÜPCÜ 8 7 5,66 5 6 3,00 12 3 11,00 6 3 5,00 5 4 3,66 6 2 5,33 42 25 33,65 92,630

246 HAKAN KENAN HARDAL 8 7 5,66 8 6 6,00 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 43 31 32,65 92,620

247 BETÜL MEÇIN 11 4 9,66 7 8 4,33 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 44 31 33,64 92,590

248 SEVTAP BAYRAKDARLAR 7 6 5,00 8 5 6,33 11 4 9,66 6 2 5,33 3 6 1,00 4 6 2,00 39 29 29,32 92,290

249 DEFNE BOZKURT 8 6 6,00 4 2 3,33 10 5 8,33 8 1 7,66 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 45 19 38,65 91,630

250 ZEYNEP MERAL TUFAN 9 3 8,00 6 5 4,33 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 7 2 6,33 9 1 8,66 45 22 37,64 91,610

251 AHMETTEFE AY 10 5 8,33 6 6 4,00 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 46 26 37,31 91,280

252 YAĞIZ ULUS 9 6 7,00 8 4 6,66 8 4 6,66 4 2 3,33 6 2 5,33 3 5 1,33 38 23 30,31 91,270

253 EMİNE UÇAR 11 2 10,33 4 7 1,66 8 5 6,33 7 2 6,33 6 3 5,00 7 3 6,00 43 22 35,65 90,610

254 YUNUS EMRE ÇELEN 8 2 7,33 7 2 6,33 9 6 7,00 3 4 1,66 1 3 0,00 7 3 6,00 35 20 28,32 90,300

254 EŞREF ARIF AKGÜL 11 4 9,66 2 8 -0,66 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 3 6 1,00 7 3 6,00 43 26 34,32 90,300

256 ESLEM HANE 6 6 4,00 7 4 5,66 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 8 1 7,66 9 1 8,66 47 20 40,31 90,290

257 ALMILA KARADENIZ 10 5 8,33 3 9 0,00 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 48 24 39,98 89,960

258 DAMLA AKTAN 6 9 3,00 7 6 5,00 11 3 10,00 7 3 6,00 6 3 5,00 7 3 6,00 44 27 35,00 89,000

259 ZEYNEP KUZU 10 5 8,33 5 9 2,00 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 5 4 3,66 5 5 3,33 43 30 32,98 88,960

259 AYAZ AÇIKGÖZ 9 6 7,00 3 1 2,66 9 3 8,00 7 2 6,33 7 1 6,66 6 2 5,33 41 15 35,98 88,960



261 SONER ŞEN 8 7 5,66 7 7 4,66 10 5 8,33 8 1 7,66 7 3 6,00 1 1 0,66 41 24 32,97 88,920

262 CEREN KAPLAN 8 7 5,66 8 7 5,66 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 44 31 33,64 88,600

263 GAMZE KAVAKLI 9 6 7,00 5 6 3,00 10 4 8,66 8 2 7,33 4 3 3,00 5 5 3,33 41 26 32,32 88,300

264 MUHAMMED EYMEN GÜNZÜ 9 5 7,33 7 6 5,00 9 5 7,33 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 0 0 0,00 37 24 28,98 87,960

265 KUMSAL KOROL 11 4 9,66 3 12 -1,00 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 46 29 36,32 87,290

266 BATUHAN DEMIR 8 7 5,66 6 5 4,33 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 45 26 36,31 87,280

267 DURU DENIZ ÇAĞLAYAN 10 4 8,66 4 4 2,66 8 6 6,00 6 3 5,00 8 1 7,66 6 4 4,66 42 22 34,64 86,600

268 ÇINAR HILALOĞULLARI 9 4 7,66 4 1 3,66 9 5 7,33 6 3 5,00 3 1 2,66 5 2 4,33 36 16 30,64 86,590

269 ALI HIKMET MUHAMMED 7 5 5,33 4 6 2,00 11 4 9,66 8 1 7,66 2 0 2,00 9 1 8,66 41 17 35,31 86,280

270 ELIFNUR BAĞATOR 10 3 9,00 6 7 3,66 7 4 5,66 7 1 6,66 4 3 3,00 5 5 3,33 39 23 31,31 86,270

271 ÖYKÜSU AKSAKAL 9 6 7,00 4 3 3,00 10 4 8,66 6 3 5,00 6 2 5,33 3 6 1,00 38 24 29,99 85,970

272 OĞUZ KAĞAN ERTOP 8 7 5,66 5 2 4,33 11 4 9,66 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 37 30 26,97 85,920

273 ZEYNO GERGİN 11 4 9,66 4 9 1,00 11 4 9,66 4 1 3,66 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 30 18 23,98 84,940

274 BERRA SİMAY SEZGİN 11 1 10,66 3 4 1,66 8 5 6,33 6 3 5,00 3 4 1,66 5 4 3,66 36 21 28,97 84,920

275 FIRDEVS ALTUNDAL 11 4 9,66 3 9 0,00 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 44 28 34,65 84,630

276 VELI BUĞRA DUMAN 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 44 31 33,65 84,620

276 DENIZ ONUR 11 2 10,33 5 6 3,00 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 38 31 27,65 84,620

278 MIRA ŞENGÜL 8 7 5,66 7 6 5,00 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 45 28 35,64 84,600

278 MERTOL ÇETIN 11 4 9,66 5 10 1,66 8 6 6,00 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 43 31 32,64 84,600

280 YIĞIT BAYRAM 7 7 4,66 4 11 0,33 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 49 25 40,64 84,590

281 DENIZ EROĞLU 9 6 7,00 7 8 4,33 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 43 32 32,31 83,280

282 BADE DÖNER 11 2 10,33 4 6 2,00 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 4 3 3,00 8 2 7,33 41 24 32,99 82,970

283 MEHMET FIDAN 11 3 10,00 3 7 0,66 9 6 7,00 8 0 8,00 1 4 -0,33 5 2 4,33 37 22 29,66 82,640

284 MUHAMMED FARUK KELEB 9 3 8,00 4 5 2,33 9 4 7,66 6 3 5,00 5 2 4,33 3 5 1,33 36 22 28,65 82,620

285 YUSUF EREN COŞKUN 12 3 11,00 7 8 4,33 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 39 36 26,98 81,970

286 EMIN ARAS GÜVEN 9 4 7,66 3 7 0,66 9 4 7,66 6 3 5,00 5 3 4,00 9 0 9,00 41 21 33,98 81,920

286 AYAZ ALI NACAK 8 7 5,66 7 7 4,66 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 38 36 25,97 81,920

288 AYBÜKE MELEK KALTAKÇ 7 3 6,00 3 6 1,00 11 4 9,66 6 1 5,66 4 3 3,00 7 3 6,00 38 20 31,32 81,300

289 KAAN EMRE MUTLU 7 8 4,33 4 6 2,00 11 4 9,66 5 5 3,33 9 1 8,66 6 2 5,33 42 26 33,31 81,280

290 ELIF ÖVGÜ TAŞ 10 5 8,33 4 10 0,66 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 4 5 2,33 43 30 32,98 80,950

291 ELA BABA 7 8 4,33 5 9 2,00 11 3 10,00 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 42 31 31,65 80,640

292 MEVLÜDE KARAYAR 7 8 4,33 6 9 3,00 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 41 34 29,64 80,610

292 ALI TAHA AKGÜL 8 7 5,66 7 8 4,33 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 0 10 -3,33 6 4 4,66 38 37 25,65 80,610

294 AYŞEGÜL KÖKÇÜ 7 7 4,66 6 2 5,33 9 6 7,00 6 3 5,00 6 3 5,00 4 5 2,33 38 26 29,32 80,290

295 CANER TAŞ 9 5 7,33 5 8 2,33 8 6 6,00 6 3 5,00 6 3 5,00 8 2 7,33 42 27 32,99 79,970

296 ELIF ERKAYA 9 4 7,66 5 7 2,66 8 6 6,00 6 2 5,33 5 2 4,33 6 3 5,00 39 24 30,98 79,940

297 MUSTAFA EFE VAHAPLAR 8 4 6,66 6 6 4,00 8 6 6,00 4 3 3,00 7 0 7,00 4 3 3,00 37 22 29,66 79,640

298 AZRA KAYA 8 7 5,66 9 6 7,00 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 3 6 1,00 4 6 2,00 37 37 24,65 79,610



299 İSMAIL REŞAT GİDERER 7 4 5,66 5 7 2,66 10 4 8,66 7 2 6,33 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 38 28 28,63 79,570

300 AHMET TALHA TÜYSÜZOĞ 9 6 7,00 7 8 4,33 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 43 32 32,32 79,300

301 MUSTAFA İSA UÇAR 10 3 9,00 5 9 2,00 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 6 3 5,00 7 2 6,33 42 28 32,66 78,650

302 İSMAIL EGE ERGÜVEN 8 7 5,66 4 7 1,66 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 2 6 0,00 6 4 4,66 38 31 27,64 78,580

303 YAĞMUR SAVAŞ 10 3 9,00 4 6 2,00 8 7 5,66 5 4 3,66 3 5 1,33 7 1 6,66 37 26 28,31 78,290

304 ZEYNEB KÖSELER 8 7 5,66 7 8 4,33 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 6 3 5,00 7 3 6,00 42 32 31,31 78,260

305 ERVA NUR KAHYA 10 5 8,33 4 9 1,00 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 40 33 28,99 77,980

306 ELIF BEYZA BAHADIR 8 6 6,00 7 7 4,66 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 7 3 6,00 40 33 28,98 77,940

307 ZEYNEP ELİF HAMAN 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 11 4 9,66 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 42 33 30,98 77,930

308 EYMEN GÖKTAŞ 8 7 5,66 5 10 1,66 11 4 9,66 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 7 3 6,00 39 36 26,98 77,920

308 BURAK KAZAK 8 7 5,66 4 11 0,33 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 42 33 30,97 77,920

310 ERVA KARABULUT 10 5 8,33 6 3 5,00 6 7 3,66 4 5 2,33 2 1 1,66 6 4 4,66 34 25 25,64 76,610

311 ECEM KARACAN 8 7 5,66 4 8 1,33 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 41 31 30,64 76,600

312 ELIF ARSLAN 8 6 6,00 4 6 2,00 9 5 7,33 8 2 7,33 5 3 4,00 5 4 3,66 39 26 30,32 76,310

313 SEZAI YIĞIT DEMIR 8 7 5,66 7 8 4,33 10 5 8,33 5 5 3,33 2 7 -0,33 2 8 -0,66 34 40 20,66 75,620

314 NIHAL YILMAZ 8 7 5,66 6 8 3,33 10 5 8,33 4 5 2,33 2 8 -0,66 6 4 4,66 36 37 23,65 75,610

315 NURSENA BÖLÜM 9 6 7,00 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 40 35 28,32 75,300

315 KEZBAN NUR KESKIN 10 5 8,33 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 40 35 28,32 75,300

315 ASYA DIPI 10 5 8,33 6 5 4,33 6 9 3,00 7 2 6,33 4 3 3,00 5 5 3,33 38 29 28,32 75,300

318 KUZEY ÇAKMAKLIOĞULLA 11 4 9,66 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 43 32 32,31 75,270

319 SEVDE RAZLIK 9 5 7,33 3 2 2,33 8 7 5,66 6 3 5,00 8 2 7,33 1 0 1,00 35 19 28,65 74,610

320 YIGIT EMIN KARADAĞ 7 6 5,00 3 7 0,66 12 3 11,00 4 5 2,33 5 2 4,33 3 6 1,00 34 29 24,32 74,300

321 SELIM YATAR 8 5 6,33 5 7 2,66 9 6 7,00 6 3 5,00 3 5 1,33 5 4 3,66 36 30 25,98 73,950

322 ÖMER YUSUF ÖZGÜL 8 7 5,66 4 11 0,33 11 4 9,66 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 8 2 7,33 39 36 26,97 73,920

323 YUSUF ÇINAR YALÇIN 10 4 8,66 4 10 0,66 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 40 33 28,97 73,910

324 AYAZ MUSTAFA TAŞKIN 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 12 3 11,00 1 6 -1,00 2 8 -0,66 4 6 2,00 32 40 18,67 73,660

325 EMEK BARIŞ 7 6 5,00 5 4 3,66 8 6 6,00 8 0 8,00 3 1 2,66 5 3 4,00 36 20 29,32 73,300

326 POYRA REŞIT DAĞCI 7 8 4,33 6 2 5,33 9 6 7,00 5 5 3,33 2 7 -0,33 5 5 3,33 34 33 22,99 72,970

327 YİĞİT DEMİR 11 4 9,66 3 12 -1,00 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 38 37 25,65 72,630

328 KAAN DORUK İNCE 7 8 4,33 7 8 4,33 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 41 34 29,64 72,600

329 DEFNE ERDINÇ 9 6 7,00 3 8 0,33 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,66 5 4 3,66 7 3 6,00 39 31 28,65 71,640

330 EGEMEN AFLAZ 7 7 4,66 5 4 3,66 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 5 4 3,66 6 4 4,66 39 28 29,63 71,570

331 AYŞEM KAYA 5 5 3,33 3 3 2,00 12 2 11,33 6 2 5,33 0 4 -1,33 3 7 0,66 29 23 21,32 71,300

332 YUSUF TAŞDEMIR AYDIN 6 7 3,66 5 7 2,66 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 41 29 31,31 71,270

333 SEMIH HAS 8 6 6,00 3 11 -0,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 2 6 0,00 5 5 3,33 37 34 25,66 70,660

334 BEREN IŞIK 8 5 6,33 3 2 2,33 7 7 4,66 6 2 5,33 6 0 6,00 7 3 6,00 37 19 30,65 70,610

335 AHMET KAMIL MALGAZ 8 5 6,33 2 13 -2,33 11 4 9,66 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 40 33 28,98 69,960

336 MINA METINGIL 8 7 5,66 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 2 8 -0,66 7 3 6,00 39 36 26,99 69,950



337 AYKUT KEKLIK 8 6 6,00 7 7 4,66 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 2 3 1,00 0 0 0,00 30 28 20,65 69,610

338 YAMAN AKSUCU 8 6 6,00 2 4 0,66 8 3 7,00 7 1 6,66 7 1 6,66 2 2 1,33 34 17 28,31 69,290

339 DEFNE ASEL BODUR 5 10 1,66 4 5 2,33 11 4 9,66 5 4 3,66 7 2 6,33 6 4 4,66 38 29 28,30 69,250

340 ÖYKÜ SAVRAN 6 8 3,33 5 6 3,00 10 5 8,33 6 3 5,00 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 36 33 24,99 68,970

341 ELIF ÇELIK 5 9 2,00 7 5 5,33 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,66 37 34 25,65 68,640

342 DERİN DEMİR 4 9 1,00 5 4 3,66 12 3 11,00 5 5 3,33 4 4 2,66 2 6 0,00 32 31 21,65 68,630

343 YASIN CEMAL UŞAR 8 7 5,66 7 8 4,33 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 38 37 25,65 68,610

344 DERİN GÜL 8 6 6,00 4 1 3,66 8 7 5,66 6 2 5,33 1 2 0,33 3 5 1,33 30 23 22,31 68,270

345 ATABERK AĞARTIR 9 6 7,00 4 10 0,66 10 5 8,33 6 3 5,00 2 7 -0,33 2 8 -0,66 33 39 20,00 67,970

346 HÜSEYİN KILINÇ 10 5 8,33 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 24 21 16,99 67,960

347 NADİRE COŞKUN 5 10 1,66 5 4 3,66 10 4 8,66 7 3 6,00 2 6 0,00 7 3 6,00 36 30 25,98 67,920

348 MIRAY KAYA 8 7 5,66 4 8 1,33 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 6 3 5,00 40 31 29,64 67,590

349 SEYMEN DOĞAN 7 5 5,33 4 6 2,00 8 6 6,00 6 3 5,00 5 3 4,00 6 3 5,00 36 26 27,33 67,320

350 NECIP EFE EĞRILMEZER 6 6 4,00 7 2 6,33 6 7 3,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 2 8 -0,66 35 29 25,33 67,300

351 FADIL EGE DERE 11 4 9,66 5 10 1,66 6 8 3,33 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 36 38 23,32 67,270

351 AHMET EREN ULUS 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 37 38 24,31 67,270

353 FURKAN BALKAN 8 7 5,66 4 11 0,33 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 29 26 20,31 67,260

354 NURSENA ÇOBAN 8 7 5,66 4 10 0,66 9 5 7,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 38 35 26,30 67,250

355 ELIF EYLÜL YAMAN 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 11 3 10,00 4 5 2,33 3 6 1,00 6 4 4,66 35 37 22,65 66,630

355 BEREN DURMUŞ 7 8 4,33 3 5 1,33 10 3 9,00 5 4 3,66 2 3 1,00 5 5 3,33 32 28 22,65 66,630

355 AYLİN YETKİN 9 6 7,00 4 6 2,00 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 4 2 3,33 0 0 0,00 31 25 22,65 66,630

358 UMUT DEMIRTAŞ 6 8 3,33 7 6 5,00 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 6 3 5,00 3 6 1,00 36 34 24,65 66,620

359 BILAL KARAKAYA 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 8 6 6,00 3 6 1,00 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 35 38 22,32 66,300

360 KAĞAN EYMEN İLHAN 7 6 5,00 3 8 0,33 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 4 3 3,00 8 1 7,66 38 27 28,99 65,980

360 BOĞAÇ KAĞAN KAHYAOĞU 9 6 7,00 3 10 -0,33 11 4 9,66 4 6 2,00 1 9 -2,00 3 7 0,66 31 42 16,99 65,980

362 YILMAZ EMRE DEMIR 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,66 39 36 26,98 65,950

363 ELA GEZGIN 8 7 5,66 7 8 4,33 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 3 7 0,66 33 42 18,98 65,930

364 MİRAY DEMİR 11 4 9,66 3 6 1,00 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 2 7 -0,33 4 6 2,00 32 36 19,99 64,960

364 ELIF ŞEN 9 6 7,00 3 3 2,00 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 3 6 1,00 3 7 0,66 32 33 20,98 64,960

366 SABRI EFE AŞCI 5 10 1,66 5 9 2,00 12 3 11,00 4 6 2,00 7 3 6,00 1 9 -2,00 34 40 20,66 64,640

367 NERGÜL COŞKUN 10 5 8,33 3 10 -0,33 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 36 37 23,65 64,630

367 MERIÇ SERIM 6 8 3,33 6 8 3,33 8 6 6,00 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 38 34 26,65 64,630

369 BEREN DEMIR 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 44 31 33,65 64,610

370 HUSAMETTIN YIGIT MER 6 9 3,00 6 3 5,00 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 3 5 1,33 8 1 7,66 37 29 27,32 64,310

371 NIL COŞKUNDENIZ 6 5 4,33 0 2 -0,66 11 4 9,66 4 4 2,66 3 2 2,33 6 2 5,33 30 19 23,65 63,640

372 İKRA ONUR 8 6 6,00 5 5 3,33 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 1 0 1,00 6 4 4,66 32 28 22,65 63,630

373 BETÜL GÜLSÜN 7 3 6,00 4 4 2,66 7 5 5,33 5 3 4,00 1 1 0,66 4 3 3,00 28 19 21,65 63,620

374 İSMAIL EGE ALKAN 9 5 7,33 4 8 1,33 8 7 5,66 5 4 3,66 4 3 3,00 1 4 -0,33 31 31 20,65 63,610



375 KEREM AKBAŞ 6 7 3,66 3 8 0,33 10 5 8,33 7 2 6,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 37 31 26,64 63,600

376 MERIÇ EGE CİVELEK 6 9 3,00 5 9 2,00 8 6 6,00 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 41 32 30,33 63,330

377 ÖYKÜ ECEM AKGÜN 9 6 7,00 7 6 5,00 5 10 1,66 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 35 38 22,32 63,300

378 BEYZA KOÇ 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 7 3 6,00 37 38 24,31 63,280

379 DORUK RAHIM DEMIRAL 9 6 7,00 4 9 1,00 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 4 4 2,66 34 37 21,65 62,630

380 GÜLBEYAZ YILMAZ 7 6 5,00 3 3 2,00 8 5 6,33 6 4 4,66 0 0 0,00 5 3 4,00 29 21 21,99 61,980

381 NURISIMA INCI 5 10 1,66 9 6 7,00 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 6 4 4,66 36 39 22,97 61,940

382 DERMAN DORUK 13 0 13,00 4 4 2,66 1 4 -0,33 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 18 8 15,33 61,320

383 ÖZAY ALI KORKMAZ 6 4 4,66 0 0 0,00 10 2 9,33 6 2 5,33 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 22 8 19,32 61,290

384 DURU YEŞILTAŞ 8 6 6,00 4 9 1,00 8 6 6,00 6 4 4,66 3 4 1,66 4 4 2,66 33 33 21,98 60,980

385 İBRAHIM EVRENKAYA 9 6 7,00 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 7 2 6,33 5 5 3,33 38 36 25,98 60,960

386 ELİF ŞEN 7 8 4,33 4 10 0,66 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 37 37 24,65 60,620

387 ÖYKÜ YETKİN 9 6 7,00 3 7 0,66 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 33 37 20,64 60,600

388 UMUT ÜNLÜ 5 10 1,66 5 10 1,66 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 38 37 25,64 60,590

388 ERVA İNCE 5 10 1,66 5 10 1,66 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 38 37 25,64 60,590

390 MUHAMMET SARIKAYA 7 6 5,00 4 8 1,33 8 5 6,33 5 5 3,33 5 4 3,66 4 5 2,33 33 33 21,98 59,960

391 BURAK ALAGÖZ 7 5 5,33 2 6 0,00 8 6 6,00 6 3 5,00 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 35 28 25,66 59,650

392 KADIR EGE KOPARAN 8 6 6,00 3 9 0,00 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 2 5 0,33 3 6 1,00 32 35 20,33 59,330

393 NILAY YAZICI 6 7 3,66 2 7 -0,33 10 4 8,66 5 3 4,00 4 3 3,00 5 3 4,00 32 27 22,99 58,960

394 YAĞIZ KORKOM 12 3 11,00 4 1 3,66 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 16 4 14,66 58,640

395 GÖKÇEM OKYAY 9 6 7,00 3 6 1,00 6 9 3,00 5 5 3,33 7 2 6,33 6 4 4,66 36 32 25,32 58,320

396 NİSA KABAÇ 8 6 6,00 1 9 -2,00 9 5 7,33 7 2 6,33 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 35 32 24,32 58,310

397 DEMIR ÖZKAN 9 6 7,00 3 11 -0,66 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 35 39 22,00 58,000

398 RECEP EMIR TUNCER 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 36 39 22,99 57,970

398 MURAT EFE DEMIR 6 9 3,00 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 9 1 8,66 39 36 26,98 57,970

400 ELIF KOCABIYIK 9 6 7,00 5 9 2,00 7 7 4,66 3 7 0,66 1 9 -2,00 6 4 4,66 31 42 16,98 57,960

401 AYAZ ÜSTÜNAY 10 5 8,33 6 6 4,00 2 0 2,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 18 11 14,33 57,320

402 EYLÜL CAN 8 6 6,00 5 4 3,66 5 8 2,33 7 2 6,33 2 7 -0,33 5 5 3,33 32 32 21,32 57,290

403 KEREM KUTLU 8 7 5,66 3 9 0,00 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 3 3 2,00 5 4 3,66 34 33 22,98 56,940

404 YİĞİT CAN ÖZER 5 10 1,66 6 8 3,33 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 5 4 3,66 7 3 6,00 37 36 24,97 56,920

405 ELIF GÜLCEMAL 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 35 40 21,65 56,630

405 ASYA MIA ÖZUYANIK 6 7 3,66 1 6 -1,00 9 3 8,00 8 0 8,00 2 4 0,66 6 2 5,33 32 22 24,65 56,630

407 TUNA BARAN 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 6 9 3,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 41 34 29,64 56,610

408 EKIN ERESEN 9 6 7,00 2 11 -1,66 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,66 3 6 1,00 2 2 1,33 31 35 19,33 56,350

409 HATICE MERYEM TOPLU 8 7 5,66 1 11 -2,66 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 6 2 5,33 6 3 5,00 37 32 26,33 56,330

410 ABDULVAHID KORKOM 7 5 5,33 2 5 0,33 9 6 7,00 4 2 3,33 0 3 -1,00 5 5 3,33 27 26 18,32 56,300

411 YIĞIT GÜNER 5 9 2,00 7 7 4,66 6 8 3,33 7 3 6,00 6 3 5,00 6 4 4,66 37 34 25,65 55,620

412 SALİH DOĞAN 6 5 4,33 7 4 5,66 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 0 10 -3,33 4 6 2,00 29 38 16,32 55,290



413 ERAY YASIN ARIDEMIR 7 8 4,33 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 37 38 24,31 55,270

414 ZEYNEP MIHRIMAH SARI 5 9 2,00 6 4 4,66 7 7 4,66 5 4 3,66 0 0 0,00 7 3 6,00 30 27 20,98 54,940

415 GAYE KURTULUŞ 5 8 2,33 5 4 3,66 8 6 6,00 3 5 1,33 1 4 -0,33 6 3 5,00 28 30 17,99 53,960

416 SELAHATTIN KÖKLÜ 5 10 1,66 7 7 4,66 9 6 7,00 3 7 0,66 3 7 0,66 2 8 -0,66 29 45 13,98 53,940

417 UMUT AKINCI 10 4 8,66 1 3 0,00 5 10 1,66 7 2 6,33 4 4 2,66 5 4 3,66 32 27 22,97 53,930

418 DEMIR DAĞLI 7 6 5,00 5 7 2,66 6 9 3,00 7 3 6,00 4 5 2,33 4 4 2,66 33 34 21,65 53,630

419 BERIL BOYRAZ 10 5 8,33 3 10 -0,33 6 9 3,00 4 6 2,00 6 3 5,00 4 5 2,33 33 38 20,33 53,330

420 ELİF TANEM ŞENTÜRK 7 8 4,33 1 12 -3,00 10 4 8,66 7 3 6,00 2 3 1,00 7 3 6,00 34 33 22,99 52,960

421 CAN DENİZ PEHLİVAN 6 7 3,66 5 9 2,00 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 6 3 5,00 35 36 22,98 52,950

422 ELVIN ŞEN 9 5 7,33 3 8 0,33 6 9 3,00 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 33 37 20,65 52,630

423 HIRA NUR AYDIN 8 4 6,66 4 5 2,33 5 7 2,66 3 6 1,00 3 5 1,33 4 3 3,00 27 30 16,98 51,930

423 AYŞE BEREN GEÇKIN 7 6 5,00 3 7 0,66 7 7 4,66 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 3 5 1,33 32 33 20,97 51,930

425 MELEK ZÜMRA AVCI 5 9 2,00 4 5 2,33 7 7 4,66 6 3 5,00 3 3 2,00 9 1 8,66 34 28 24,65 51,620

425 AYAZ SERT 6 7 3,66 5 6 3,00 7 8 4,33 5 4 3,66 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 31 37 18,65 51,620

427 NİSA BUĞLEM PEHLİVAN 10 5 8,33 3 10 -0,33 6 9 3,00 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 32 41 18,32 51,320

428 MIRAY AÇIKGÖZ 8 7 5,66 2 10 -1,33 7 6 5,00 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 35 35 23,32 51,310

428 KEREM İPEKLİLER 7 8 4,33 2 11 -1,66 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 38 35 26,32 51,310

430 KEMAL ARDA MERIÇ 6 8 3,33 7 5 5,33 6 9 3,00 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 30 41 16,32 51,300

431 ÖMER FARUK CEYLAN 7 8 4,33 6 9 3,00 4 11 0,33 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 40 35 28,31 51,290

432 YAVUZ SELIM IDE 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,66 34 41 20,31 51,270

433 ELIF SU DOĞAN 8 7 5,66 3 12 -1,00 8 7 5,66 4 6 2,00 5 4 3,66 5 3 4,00 33 39 19,98 50,940

434 DURU SERDAR 6 9 3,00 7 5 5,33 6 9 3,00 6 3 5,00 3 6 1,00 2 8 -0,66 30 40 16,67 50,660

435 MUHAMMET EFE KOCAKÜL 8 6 6,00 2 12 -2,00 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 6 4 4,66 34 39 20,98 49,960

436 EBRU ÇAKIR 8 7 5,66 1 10 -2,33 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 35 36 22,98 49,950

437 MİRAY ÇIFTÇIOĞLU 7 7 4,66 3 7 0,66 8 7 5,66 3 7 0,66 1 6 -1,00 7 3 6,00 29 37 16,64 49,580

438 GÜNEŞ ER 8 6 6,00 2 6 0,00 6 9 3,00 8 2 7,33 3 2 2,33 5 4 3,66 32 29 22,32 49,320

439 ALI EYMEN BAYRAK 7 8 4,33 4 11 0,33 9 6 7,00 4 5 2,33 4 6 2,00 1 8 -1,66 29 44 14,33 49,310

440 SEVDE TAŞDAN 5 7 2,66 6 8 3,33 5 8 2,33 6 3 5,00 9 1 8,66 4 5 2,33 35 32 24,31 49,270

441 ELÇIN KOZAK 5 7 2,66 5 4 3,66 8 7 5,66 4 6 2,00 1 8 -1,66 3 7 0,66 26 39 12,98 48,920

442 İSMAIL URAS SAROHAN 6 8 3,33 3 9 0,00 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 6 0 6,00 7 3 6,00 36 31 25,66 48,640

443 AÇELYA COŞKUN 11 4 9,66 3 7 0,66 3 3 2,00 1 4 -0,33 0 2 -0,66 1 2 0,33 19 22 11,66 48,620

444 EEIF ULUKÖK 7 7 4,66 5 8 2,33 6 6 4,00 4 6 2,00 3 4 1,66 3 7 0,66 28 38 15,31 48,280

445 EYMEN ISSI 5 10 1,66 3 7 0,66 9 6 7,00 5 3 4,00 3 2 2,33 6 4 4,66 31 32 20,31 48,270

446 ILKEM KURŞUNLU 7 8 4,33 4 11 0,33 7 6 5,00 6 3 5,00 2 8 -0,66 6 4 4,66 32 40 18,66 47,640

447 KEMALEFE ÇELIKCAN 4 10 0,66 1 11 -2,66 13 2 12,33 6 4 4,66 1 6 -1,00 4 5 2,33 29 38 16,32 47,310

448 AYŞE BETÜL BAYRAM 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,66 34 41 20,31 47,280

449 ÖZENNAZ ÇANDIR 7 6 5,00 5 6 3,00 5 9 2,00 6 3 5,00 1 8 -1,66 5 5 3,33 29 37 16,67 46,670

450 NURSIMA YILMAZ 6 5 4,33 4 2 3,33 4 5 2,33 7 2 6,33 0 4 -1,33 2 6 0,00 23 24 14,99 44,960



451 ESLEM TAŞÇI 6 9 3,00 4 11 0,33 9 6 7,00 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 3 7 0,66 29 46 13,65 44,640

451 AHMET YASIN KAZANPIN 7 8 4,33 6 8 3,33 6 8 3,33 4 6 2,00 2 8 -0,66 2 8 -0,66 27 46 11,67 44,640

453 BERRANUR İŞLEK 5 10 1,66 4 11 0,33 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 6 4 4,66 32 43 17,65 44,620

454 EYMEN MERSIN 8 7 5,66 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 32 43 17,64 44,610

455 YAĞIZ ÇAKAR 7 8 4,33 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 3 6 1,00 2 8 -0,66 4 6 2,00 28 46 12,66 43,620

456 AKİLE TEKİN 8 7 5,66 4 10 0,66 6 9 3,00 4 6 2,00 5 4 3,66 3 7 0,66 30 43 15,64 43,600

457 MUHAMMED ALİ TOPAL 6 9 3,00 5 8 2,33 6 8 3,33 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 31 41 17,31 43,290

458 KERIMCAN TAŞDEMIR 5 9 2,00 0 1 -0,33 8 6 6,00 7 3 6,00 4 5 2,33 5 4 3,66 29 28 19,66 42,670

459 MUSTAFA BARUT 6 8 3,33 3 12 -1,00 9 6 7,00 5 5 3,33 2 7 -0,33 4 6 2,00 29 44 14,33 42,320

459 ÇAĞLAR AY 5 9 2,00 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 4 6 2,00 1 8 -1,66 6 4 4,66 29 44 14,33 42,320

461 GÜLISTAN ALDEMİR 6 9 3,00 2 9 -1,00 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 3 7 0,66 29 42 14,98 41,980

462 NEHIR ŞENER 5 9 2,00 3 5 1,33 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 31 36 18,99 41,970

463 NİHAT BOZKURT 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 2 8 -0,66 3 7 0,66 30 45 14,99 41,960

463 ENSAR YILDIZ 7 8 4,33 7 8 4,33 5 10 1,66 4 6 2,00 2 8 -0,66 2 8 -0,66 27 48 11,00 41,960

463 ELIF KIRÇIL 6 9 3,00 4 10 0,66 9 6 7,00 3 7 0,66 1 9 -2,00 3 7 0,66 26 48 9,98 41,960

466 ESMASU BILGIN 6 9 3,00 2 12 -2,00 7 8 4,33 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 37 37 24,65 40,640

467 MEHMET EMIN KURTBEY 7 8 4,33 4 11 0,33 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 4 6 2,00 29 46 13,66 40,630

468 MUTTALIP EFE ÇELIK 5 10 1,66 3 12 -1,00 10 5 8,33 3 7 0,66 1 9 -2,00 7 3 6,00 29 46 13,65 40,620

469 GÜNEY DÜZGÜN 6 5 4,33 2 3 1,00 2 2 1,33 4 1 3,66 4 0 4,00 7 3 6,00 25 14 20,32 40,300

470 AYNUR ACAR 5 10 1,66 5 6 3,00 7 7 4,66 6 4 4,66 1 6 -1,00 2 8 -0,66 26 41 12,32 40,280

471 EDA ÜNAL 10 5 8,33 1 13 -3,33 6 7 3,66 6 4 4,66 2 7 -0,33 3 7 0,66 28 43 13,65 39,630

472 AÇELYA MERT 7 8 4,33 4 11 0,33 7 8 4,33 4 6 2,00 1 9 -2,00 5 4 3,66 28 46 12,65 39,620

473 SERVAN YAHYA GÖNÜLTA 5 10 1,66 3 10 -0,33 7 7 4,66 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 34 38 21,31 39,280

473 MUSTAFA KOYUNCU 5 10 1,66 6 8 3,33 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 30 44 15,31 39,280

475 ZEYNEP ÇANAKCI 6 8 3,33 1 1 0,66 7 4 5,66 2 4 0,66 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 16 17 10,31 39,260

475 MELEK GEZER 8 7 5,66 5 10 1,66 4 11 0,33 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 7 3 6,00 31 44 16,31 39,260

477 IKRA ABAK 5 7 2,66 3 7 0,66 6 8 3,33 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 5 4 3,66 30 35 18,31 38,260

478 FATMANUR GÖKBUĞA 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 2 8 -0,66 30 45 15,00 37,980

479 BELINAY ARIKBAŞ 6 9 3,00 4 10 0,66 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,66 32 42 17,98 37,960

480 YIĞIT PALAZ 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 5 10 1,66 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 33 42 18,98 37,940

481 EDANAZ KUŞ 8 7 5,66 5 10 1,66 5 10 1,66 6 4 4,66 0 10 -3,33 3 7 0,66 27 48 10,97 37,910

482 ZEHRA ÜZÜM 9 6 7,00 2 13 -2,33 7 8 4,33 0 9 -3,00 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 26 48 10,00 37,000

483 ÖMER BORA ŞIRIN 4 6 2,00 2 7 -0,33 6 5 4,33 2 4 0,66 9 0 9,00 4 2 3,33 27 24 18,99 36,990

484 AYAZ AKKIN 6 8 3,33 1 12 -3,00 9 3 8,00 4 5 2,33 3 4 1,66 1 4 -0,33 24 36 11,99 36,980

485 SUDENAZ KURTOĞLU 6 9 3,00 4 11 0,33 7 8 4,33 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 29 46 13,65 36,630

486 RÜZGAR AYAZ KARAKÖSE 4 11 0,33 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 32 43 17,64 36,600

487 HIRA ÖZCAN 5 10 1,66 4 11 0,33 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 29 46 13,64 36,590

488 ASYA KAYNAK 7 5 5,33 0 1 -0,33 5 9 2,00 6 3 5,00 2 0 2,00 3 5 1,33 23 23 15,33 36,330



489 NIDA CUCA 3 11 -0,66 3 10 -0,33 10 5 8,33 5 5 3,33 3 5 1,33 4 6 2,00 28 42 14,00 36,020

490 SEFA DORUK KALE 6 9 3,00 2 12 -2,00 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 3 5 1,33 30 42 15,99 35,970

491 NIDA SERPIL KORKMAZ 7 8 4,33 3 12 -1,00 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 3 6 1,00 6 4 4,66 31 43 16,65 35,640

492 SELEN SÜREN 6 8 3,33 6 8 3,33 3 12 -1,00 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 6 3 5,00 32 40 18,65 35,630

493 RAMAZAN EYMEN KAVAZ 6 6 4,00 1 11 -2,66 6 6 4,00 7 1 6,66 4 3 3,00 5 2 4,33 29 29 19,33 35,350

494 DORUK TÜRKDOĞAN 8 5 6,33 1 12 -3,00 6 9 3,00 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 30 41 16,32 35,310

495 ECE MINA ÖZDEMIR 7 7 4,66 2 10 -1,33 7 8 4,33 4 3 3,00 1 9 -2,00 5 4 3,66 26 41 12,32 35,300

496 EMİR ÇAKIR 8 5 6,33 4 8 1,33 4 9 1,00 3 5 1,33 1 6 -1,00 1 6 -1,00 21 39 7,99 33,970

497 MERT ALI SAVAŞ 9 5 7,33 5 10 1,66 3 12 -1,00 3 7 0,66 3 7 0,66 3 7 0,66 26 48 9,97 33,940

498 BELINAY ERTEN 5 6 3,00 1 4 -0,33 6 7 3,66 5 1 4,66 0 0 0,00 5 4 3,66 22 22 14,65 33,640

498 AMINE SERDAR 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 1 6 -1,00 26 46 10,66 33,640

500 EBRAR CANLI 5 10 1,66 2 13 -2,33 8 6 6,00 7 3 6,00 3 6 1,00 6 4 4,66 31 42 16,99 32,980

501 BÜLENT BARLAS TAŞTAN 7 8 4,33 3 9 0,00 6 8 3,33 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 2 8 -0,66 25 46 9,67 32,650

501 DOĞA ATEŞ 4 10 0,66 0 4 -1,33 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 29 34 17,65 32,620

502 SHIRIN KADYROVA 5 6 3,00 5 6 3,00 3 7 0,66 3 2 2,33 4 3 3,00 2 6 0,00 22 30 11,99 31,970

503 GÖRKEM GÖKKAYA 6 7 3,66 3 5 1,33 5 8 2,33 5 4 3,66 2 7 -0,33 2 8 -0,66 23 39 9,99 31,950

504 FATIH KOCABAY 3 12 -1,00 3 1 2,66 7 7 4,66 5 4 3,66 4 5 2,33 3 7 0,66 25 36 12,97 31,930

505 HAZAL PEHLIVAN 6 5 4,33 1 3 0,00 3 3 2,00 5 1 4,66 1 1 0,66 2 3 1,00 18 16 12,65 31,640

506 UMUT KERIM ÜRGÜN 6 9 3,00 3 11 -0,66 7 8 4,33 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 27 47 11,33 31,340

507 MUHAMMED ERDEM ATEŞ 5 10 1,66 3 10 -0,33 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 29 44 14,32 31,300

508 FURKAN NADIR ÖZER 6 9 3,00 3 11 -0,66 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 29 45 14,00 30,020

509 İREM AVCI 6 8 3,33 2 6 0,00 6 9 3,00 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 25 42 10,98 29,970

510 ZEYNEB EYLÜL BULGURC 7 8 4,33 7 4 5,66 0 12 -4,00 4 3 3,00 1 0 1,00 3 3 2,00 22 30 11,99 29,960

511 EYLÜL EBRAR YAVAŞ 6 9 3,00 3 11 -0,66 6 9 3,00 4 6 2,00 1 8 -1,66 8 2 7,33 28 45 13,01 29,030

512 YASIN ÇINAR TAŞTAN 6 8 3,33 5 9 2,00 5 10 1,66 4 5 2,33 3 7 0,66 1 9 -2,00 24 48 7,98 28,950

512 KORAY KILINÇ 5 10 1,66 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 4 5 2,33 3 2 2,33 5 4 3,66 27 41 13,31 28,280

513 GÖRKEMKARAKOBAK 5 10 1,66 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 4 5 2,33 28 46 12,64 27,610

514 HATICE ERSÖZ 7 8 4,33 3 12 -1,00 5 10 1,66 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 28 47 12,31 27,280

515 EROL ÇINAR KIRAR 5 8 2,33 5 10 1,66 5 10 1,66 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 26 47 10,31 27,260

516 ABDULSAMED HAMAN 5 10 1,66 4 11 0,33 6 7 3,66 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 3 6 1,00 25 47 9,31 26,260

517 HAKAN BIZNAK 5 7 2,66 1 5 -0,66 5 5 3,33 4 2 3,33 1 1 0,66 1 1 0,66 17 21 9,98 25,970

518 UMUT DENIZ YAPLI 5 10 1,66 5 8 2,33 6 9 3,00 3 7 0,66 2 8 -0,66 1 9 -2,00 22 51 4,99 25,960

519 ASYA KOÇ 8 6 6,00 1 5 -0,66 3 6 1,00 1 5 -0,66 3 7 0,66 1 4 -0,33 17 33 6,01 25,030

520 HAFSA ÇOBAN 6 9 3,00 1 10 -2,33 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 4 6 2,00 25 46 9,67 24,670

521 İBRAHIM ÇAKMAK 7 6 5,00 5 9 2,00 4 11 0,33 2 8 -0,66 1 9 -2,00 1 9 -2,00 20 52 2,67 24,660

522 NISA NUR TANYERI 5 10 1,66 2 13 -2,33 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 29 46 13,65 24,630

522 ELIF ALLAN 5 7 2,66 3 8 0,33 5 9 2,00 4 5 2,33 3 5 1,33 3 6 1,00 23 40 9,65 24,620

523 ELIF SINOP 3 5 1,33 3 6 1,00 6 8 3,33 4 3 3,00 3 7 0,66 0 7 -2,33 19 36 6,99 23,970



524 NIDA FIDAN 6 7 3,66 4 9 1,00 4 8 1,33 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 14 24 5,99 23,960

525 ELIFRAVZA ALP 8 7 5,66 4 10 0,66 3 12 -1,00 2 8 -0,66 2 8 -0,66 5 5 3,33 24 50 7,33 23,290

526 HELIN TEKIN 3 12 -1,00 3 11 -0,66 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 5 5 3,33 26 48 10,00 22,000

527 ATA ÇINAR KILIÇ 5 10 1,66 2 13 -2,33 7 7 4,66 6 2 5,33 3 7 0,66 2 6 0,00 25 45 9,98 21,950

528 AYŞE KOZ 3 12 -1,00 3 12 -1,00 6 9 3,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 32 43 17,66 20,660

529 ZEYNEPSU GÖNÜLTAŞ 5 10 1,66 2 13 -2,33 6 9 3,00 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 29 46 13,66 20,650

530 MENESA AKMAZ 5 9 2,00 2 13 -2,33 5 10 1,66 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 31 43 16,65 20,640

531 ÜMMUHAN YAREN DOĞAN 6 9 3,00 0 0 0,00 0 1 -0,33 4 4 2,66 1 0 1,00 7 3 6,00 18 17 12,33 20,340

532 FEYZA DERELER 4 10 0,66 2 13 -2,33 6 8 3,33 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 3 6 1,00 29 43 14,65 19,630

533 ELIF GÜVEN 6 9 3,00 6 9 3,00 1 14 -3,66 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 28 47 12,33 19,350

533 HAZAL DEMIRTAŞ 4 11 0,33 2 6 0,00 5 2 4,33 1 0 1,00 0 1 -0,33 0 0 0,00 12 20 5,33 19,310

534 BINNUR NAZLIM 5 9 2,00 5 9 2,00 4 10 0,66 1 6 -1,00 4 6 2,00 2 8 -0,66 21 48 5,00 18,980

535 AYAZ TUĞRUL KOCABAŞ 7 8 4,33 3 10 -0,33 4 11 0,33 4 5 2,33 3 7 0,66 1 9 -2,00 22 50 5,32 18,310

536 EMİR YASİN AYTAN 6 9 3,00 2 13 -2,33 5 9 2,00 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 26 48 9,99 18,000

537 TEVFIK MERT YALLI 5 10 1,66 1 13 -3,33 8 7 5,66 2 8 -0,66 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 23 51 6,00 17,970

538 ANIL ERCAN 5 10 1,66 2 10 -1,33 7 7 4,66 2 8 -0,66 1 9 -2,00 3 7 0,66 20 51 2,99 17,960

539 BUKET KOCAKAYA 5 6 3,00 1 6 -1,00 4 6 2,00 4 2 3,33 0 0 0,00 0 6 -2,00 14 26 5,33 17,330

540 ALI ATEŞOĞLU 5 10 1,66 3 10 -0,33 4 8 1,33 6 3 5,00 4 6 2,00 2 7 -0,33 24 44 9,33 17,310

541 İSMET METE ERACAR 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 4 6 2,00 2 6 0,00 2 7 -0,33 22 50 5,33 16,310

542 YUSUF TILKI 6 9 3,00 2 10 -1,33 5 9 2,00 2 8 -0,66 2 8 -0,66 4 5 2,33 21 49 4,68 15,690

543 BERAT KAYATAŞ 5 7 2,66 5 8 2,33 3 10 -0,33 1 7 -1,33 2 6 0,00 1 8 -1,66 17 46 1,67 15,650

544 EFE YIĞIT SOLAK 6 9 3,00 4 11 0,33 3 11 -0,66 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,66 1 9 -2,00 24 50 7,33 15,340

544 HEJAR AVAĞ 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 5 10 1,66 4 6 2,00 4 5 2,33 3 7 0,66 24 50 7,31 14,270

545 GÜLCAN KILINÇ 4 11 0,33 2 13 -2,33 8 7 5,66 2 8 -0,66 4 6 2,00 1 9 -2,00 21 54 3,00 13,980

546 BURAK 6 9 3,00 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 3 7 0,66 1 9 -2,00 3 7 0,66 21 54 2,98 13,960

547 TAHA DEMİROĞLU 4 10 0,66 4 10 0,66 4 11 0,33 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 25 48 8,97 13,920

548 ÖYKÜ ÇELIKÇI 3 9 0,00 1 12 -3,00 8 5 6,33 3 6 1,00 1 8 -1,66 2 7 -0,33 18 47 2,34 12,330

549 SAIT MIRAÇ BINICI 3 12 -1,00 4 5 2,33 5 10 1,66 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 12 27 2,99 11,960

550 AVNİ MUTLU KARACAN 3 12 -1,00 5 9 2,00 5 10 1,66 4 6 2,00 3 6 1,00 1 9 -2,00 21 52 3,66 11,640

551 DERINSU ÇELIK 5 10 1,66 3 12 -1,00 5 10 1,66 2 8 -0,66 4 6 2,00 3 6 1,00 22 52 4,66 11,620

552 FEYZA ÇOBAN 3 10 -0,33 4 8 1,33 3 12 -1,00 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 26 44 11,32 11,320

553 ERKAN ÜNAL 4 11 0,33 2 13 -2,33 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 1 9 -2,00 3 7 0,66 22 53 4,32 11,310

554 SEMA NUR ÖZDEMIR 5 10 1,66 3 12 -1,00 5 10 1,66 5 5 3,33 1 9 -2,00 3 7 0,66 22 53 4,31 11,270

554 GAYE YILMAZ 3 10 -0,33 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 25 48 8,99 9,980

555 AZRA KARDAŞCAN 4 10 0,66 4 8 1,33 3 11 -0,66 5 4 3,66 3 7 0,66 2 8 -0,66 21 48 4,99 8,980

556 EFLIN PEHLIVAN 4 8 1,33 2 9 -1,00 5 9 2,00 1 8 -1,66 2 8 -0,66 2 7 -0,33 16 49 -0,32 6,670

557 BENGÜ SENA YALÇINKAY 6 9 3,00 0 0 0,00 2 12 -2,00 3 2 2,33 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 11 23 3,33 6,330

558 MAHINUR DEMIRTAŞ 4 10 0,66 1 10 -2,33 4 9 1,00 6 3 5,00 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 23 44 8,33 6,320



559 EGEMEN KORKMAZ 4 10 0,66 2 10 -1,33 4 9 1,00 6 4 4,66 2 6 0,00 2 7 -0,33 20 46 4,66 5,650

560 HIRANUR YILMAZ 3 10 -0,33 2 8 -0,66 5 9 2,00 4 6 2,00 2 8 -0,66 2 7 -0,33 18 48 2,02 5,050

561 NISA NUR ULAS 2 9 -1,00 3 10 -0,33 4 9 1,00 5 3 4,00 1 3 0,00 4 6 2,00 19 40 5,67 4,680

562 HAKAN ULUK 3 10 -0,33 2 9 -1,00 5 10 1,66 6 4 4,66 2 7 -0,33 1 7 -1,33 19 47 3,33 4,320

563 MUSTAFA BAYRAM SAVAŞ 5 8 2,33 2 13 -2,33 4 11 0,33 5 4 3,66 2 7 -0,33 2 8 -0,66 20 51 3,00 3,990

564 YUSUF KAMER 5 10 1,66 0 14 -4,66 4 10 0,66 7 3 6,00 3 5 1,33 7 3 6,00 26 45 10,99 3,970

565 DİLA BERRÜ 3 12 -1,00 4 9 1,00 3 12 -1,00 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 4 5 2,33 23 49 6,66 3,660

565 RÜZGAR BOSTANCIOĞLU 3 9 0,00 5 9 2,00 2 11 -1,66 2 5 0,33 4 6 2,00 2 8 -0,66 18 48 2,01 3,030

566 AYAZ KAHYAOĞULLARI 4 8 1,33 2 8 -0,66 3 9 0,00 3 4 1,66 1 5 -0,66 1 5 -0,66 14 39 1,01 3,020

567 HATICE SENA İNAN 3 8 0,33 2 2 1,33 3 12 -1,00 4 6 2,00 1 9 -2,00 2 8 -0,66 15 45 0,00 1,980

568 BASRI ADEM GÖRGÜLÜ 2 6 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 2 6 0,00 0,000

569 DAMLANUR GÖNÜLTAŞ 5 8 2,33 3 11 -0,66 2 13 -2,33 1 8 -1,66 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 18 53 0,34 -1,640

570 DURU AYDIN 3 12 -1,00 2 9 -1,00 3 8 0,33 3 5 1,33 2 4 0,66 4 4 2,66 17 42 2,98 -2,030

571 MÜMINE DEMIR 2 13 -2,33 3 11 -0,66 5 10 1,66 2 8 -0,66 0 0 0,00 5 5 3,33 17 47 1,34 -2,650

572 YIĞIT KARA 3 12 -1,00 3 12 -1,00 3 11 -0,66 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 5 5 3,33 22 52 4,67 -3,310

573 MUSTAFA BILAL ŞENOL 6 9 3,00 3 11 -0,66 1 14 -3,66 1 9 -2,00 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 18 56 -0,66 -4,620

574 AYŞENUR SAÇKESEN 2 13 -2,33 1 14 -3,66 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 1 9 -2,00 6 4 4,66 22 53 4,33 -4,640

575 İHSAN EREN ŞİMLEK 0 5 -1,66 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 5 -1,66 -6,640

576 ECRİN EBRAR AVCI 1 14 -3,66 3 12 -1,00 5 10 1,66 2 8 -0,66 3 7 0,66 3 7 0,66 17 58 -2,34 -11,340

576 EMIR BERK BASARAN 2 13 -2,33 0 9 -3,00 3 4 1,66 1 7 -1,33 3 5 1,33 3 3 2,00 12 41 -1,67 -12,680

577 EKREM BABA 2 9 -1,00 2 12 -2,00 1 10 -2,33 5 4 3,66 1 9 -2,00 6 4 4,66 17 48 0,99 -15,000

578 MELISA ŞERBETÇIOĞLU 4 11 0,33 3 12 -1,00 1 13 -3,33 5 5 3,33 1 9 -2,00 1 9 -2,00 15 59 -4,67 -16,670

579 DILARA GÜVEN 3 12 -1,00 0 11 -3,66 3 9 0,00 3 7 0,66 0 7 -2,33 2 7 -0,33 11 53 -6,66 -20,640

580 İREM AYDIN 3 12 -1,00 2 13 -2,33 3 12 -1,00 3 7 0,66 2 8 -0,66 0 10 -3,33 13 62 -7,66 -20,650


