
D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N
00282 KADİRCAN GEYİKLİ 10 4 8,66 14 1 13,66 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 64 10 60,65 160,610 1 ASİL
00292 KUTAY  UYGUN 9 5 7,33 12 1 11,66 14 1 13,66 8 1 7,66 10 0 10,00 7 2 6,33 60 10 56,64 154,590 2 ASİL
00062 BARLAS ALP 10 4 8,66 12 3 11,00 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 62 12 57,99 153,960 3 ASİL
00254 IRMAK ULUKAN 8 5 6,33 12 1 11,66 14 1 13,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 62 9 58,97 153,920 4 ASİL
00034 ARYA DENİZ TOKER 11 4 9,66 9 0 9,00 13 2 12,33 9 0 9,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 62 6 59,99 152,960 5 ASİL
00056 AZRA ELİBOL 9 6 7,00 12 3 11,00 14 1 13,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 62 13 57,65 152,630 6 ASİL
00303 MEHMET ÇAKIR 10 3 9,00 11 2 10,33 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 59 12 54,99 149,970 7 ASİL
00458 YUSUF EREN GÖKKAYA 9 6 7,00 12 1 11,66 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 62 11 58,32 147,300 8 ASİL
00346 MUSTAFA KARACAOĞLU 11 2 10,33 9 3 8,00 12 2 11,33 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 61 8 58,32 147,300 8 ASİL
00269 İREM DİNÇER 10 5 8,33 11 3 10,00 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 60 14 55,32 147,300 8 ASİL
00212 FATİH DEMİRKOL 8 7 5,66 14 1 13,66 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 63 12 58,98 145,920 11 ASİL
00128 ECEM NAZ FERAH 10 5 8,33 12 3 11,00 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 62 13 57,65 144,620 12 ASİL
00430 TALHA YAŞAR 10 4 8,66 10 4 8,66 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 59 14 54,30 143,250 13 ASİL
00204 EYMEN EGE KARANİ 8 6 6,00 11 2 10,33 14 1 13,66 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 56 16 50,65 140,620 14 ASİL
00014 AHMET YUSUF AYAN 9 6 7,00 9 5 7,33 14 1 13,66 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 61 13 56,65 140,620 14 ASİL
00044 AYÇA AYŞE ÖCAL 7 7 4,66 11 1 10,66 14 1 13,66 7 2 6,33 10 0 10,00 7 1 6,66 56 12 51,97 138,910 16 ASİL
00032 ARİF TAMAY SAĞLAMOĞLU 9 4 7,66 9 2 8,33 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 57 12 52,98 137,940 17 ASİL
00192 ESİLA SATIK 9 6 7,00 10 3 9,00 13 2 12,33 8 0 8,00 10 0 10,00 6 1 5,66 56 12 51,99 136,980 18 ASİL
00108 DENİZ ÖZCAN      8 7 5,66 9 4 7,66 14 1 13,66 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 60 13 55,64 136,580 19 ASİL
00126 ECE KORKUT 8 7 5,66 10 3 9,00 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 59 14 54,31 135,280 20 ASİL
00116 DORUK EYMEN UĞUR 6 8 3,33 13 0 13,00 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 57 15 51,98 133,970 21 ASİL
00356 NİSA AKKOÇ 8 7 5,66 10 3 9,00 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 58 15 52,97 133,940 22 ASİL
00297 MAHMUD SAMİ ÖZSOY 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,66 11 4 9,66 9 0 9,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 55 19 48,64 131,590 23 ASİL
00478 ZEYNEP NUR ŞENGÜL 10 5 8,33 11 3 10,00 10 5 8,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 57 17 51,32 131,300 24 ASİL
00187 EREN YILMAZ 8 7 5,66 11 1 10,66 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 4 6 2,00 55 17 49,32 131,280 25 ASİL
00313 MEHMET ERTÜRK 7 7 4,66 9 3 8,00 14 1 13,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 57 14 52,31 131,270 26 ASİL
00202 EYLÜL SENA KARAN 9 4 7,66 7 1 6,66 13 2 12,33 9 0 9,00 9 0 9,00 7 1 6,66 54 8 51,31 131,260 27 ASİL
00472 ZEYNEP KARTALMIŞ 8 7 5,66 12 3 11,00 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 8 1 7,66 9 1 8,66 57 17 51,30 130,260 28 ASİL
00146 ELİF AKTAŞ 6 8 3,33 9 2 8,33 15 0 15,00 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,66 55 15 49,98 129,960 29 ASİL
00252 ILGAZ ÖKMENER 9 6 7,00 9 5 7,33 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 58 16 52,65 128,640 30 ASİL
00432 TOPRAK GİTMEZ 8 7 5,66 11 4 9,66 13 2 12,33 5 2 4,33 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 52 20 45,30 128,250 31 ASİL
00025 ALYA KÖKEN 7 6 5,00 10 2 9,33 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 9 0 9,00 9 1 8,66 56 13 51,65 127,640 32 ASİL
00189 ERHAN BARTU AKGÜN 6 9 3,00 11 3 10,00 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 57 17 51,32 127,310 33 ASİL
00030 ARDA UTKAN OLÇUM 9 5 7,33 10 3 9,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 3 4 1,66 51 18 44,98 126,970 34 ASİL
00218 FURKAN AHMET YAMAN 6 6 4,00 7 2 6,33 15 0 15,00 9 0 9,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 54 11 50,32 126,310 35 ASİL
00121 DURU BURCU 7 8 4,33 9 6 7,00 14 1 13,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 57 18 50,98 125,950 36 ASİL
00368 ÖMER EGE DİNÇ 5 10 1,66 12 3 11,00 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 59 16 53,66 124,640 37 ASİL
00010 AHMET EYMEN ÇAKMAK 9 5 7,33 8 3 7,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 53 17 47,32 123,310 38 ASİL
00159 ELİF ÖZDAŞ 6 9 3,00 11 2 10,33 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 53 20 46,31 123,290 39 ASİL
00301 MEHMET CAN YILMAZ 5 10 1,66 12 2 11,33 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 54 20 47,31 123,270 40 ASİL
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00431 TİMUÇİN UMUTLU 7 7 4,66 11 2 10,33 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 55 17 49,31 123,260 41 YEDEK

00332 MİRAY GİRGİN 9 6 7,00 8 5 6,33 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 7 2 6,33 55 17 49,32 122,310 42 YEDEK

00267 İPEK ÇETİN 9 3 8,00 8 3 7,00 11 4 9,66 7 2 6,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 53 14 48,32 122,300 43 YEDEK

00193 ESLEM ECE ATEŞ 7 7 4,66 11 2 10,33 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 6 3 5,00 54 17 48,31 122,260 44 YEDEK

00268 İPEK KAZAK 8 6 6,00 8 5 6,33 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 57 15 51,99 121,980 45 YEDEK

00232 GÜRKAN TATLICI 8 7 5,66 12 3 11,00 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 51 24 42,97 121,930 46 YEDEK

00363 OĞUZ KAĞAN SAVAŞ 7 7 4,66 8 1 7,66 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 5 4 3,66 52 15 46,97 120,920 47 YEDEK

00127 ECE ŞİMŞEK 7 7 4,66 9 2 8,33 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,66 54 16 48,65 120,620 48 YEDEK

00095 ÇAĞLA KUDU 9 6 7,00 10 1 9,66 14 1 13,66 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 2 -0,66 33 10 29,66 120,620 48 YEDEK

00465 ZEYNEP AZRA ARSLAN 6 8 3,33 9 1 8,66 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 53 16 47,64 120,600 50 YEDEK

00348 MUSTAFA KURTULDU 7 7 4,66 7 4 5,66 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 57 13 52,65 120,600 50 YEDEK

00351 NEHİR AKKAŞ 10 5 8,33 7 8 4,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 55 20 48,32 119,300 52 YEDEK

00277 İSMAİL BUĞRA FİLİZCİ 9 4 7,66 7 4 5,66 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 9 0 9,00 5 4 3,66 51 16 45,64 118,600 53 YEDEK

00290 KEREM TETİK 8 7 5,66 9 6 7,00 11 3 10,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 55 19 48,65 116,630 54 YEDEK

00380 ÖZÜM DENİZ GÜVEN 8 5 6,33 7 3 6,00 11 1 10,66 8 0 8,00 8 1 7,66 9 1 8,66 51 11 47,31 116,280 55 YEDEK

00286 KEREM AĞIL 5 8 2,33 11 0 11,00 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 7 1 6,66 52 15 46,97 115,940 56 YEDEK

00426 ŞÜKRÜ  ENES GEDİZ 6 9 3,00 10 5 8,33 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 55 20 48,33 115,320 57 YEDEK

00287 KEREM AYDIN 7 5 5,33 9 4 7,66 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 53 17 47,31 115,260 58 YEDEK

00339 MUHAMMET ALİ GÜRSOY 8 7 5,66 11 3 10,00 10 5 8,33 6 3 5,00 9 0 9,00 5 2 4,33 49 20 42,32 114,290 59 YEDEK

00414 SULTAN SEÇKİN 6 9 3,00 10 5 8,33 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 50 25 41,65 112,630 60 YEDEK

00168 ELVİN SÜN 8 7 5,66 8 7 5,66 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 53 22 45,65 112,610 61

00352 NEHİR GEREK 6 9 3,00 11 4 9,66 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 53 22 45,64 112,600 62

00147 ELİF ASLI KURT 8 7 5,66 7 6 5,00 13 2 12,33 9 0 9,00 7 3 6,00 6 3 5,00 50 21 42,99 111,960 63

00195 ESLEM ESİLA BULUT 8 6 6,00 7 6 5,00 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 52 20 45,32 111,320 64

00347 MUSTAFA KARCI 7 7 4,66 7 5 5,33 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 54 17 48,31 111,280 65

00101 ÇINAR TÜREMEN 9 6 7,00 9 4 7,66 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 50 23 42,31 111,280 66

00114 DİLAY TEKİN 6 4 4,66 9 0 9,00 11 3 10,00 4 1 3,66 9 0 9,00 3 1 2,66 42 9 38,98 109,960 67

00374 ÖYKÜ ÇELİK 7 8 4,33 10 5 8,33 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 54 21 46,97 109,940 68

00081 BERRA NAS DAĞDELEN 8 7 5,66 9 5 7,33 10 5 8,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 53 21 45,98 109,940 69

00005 ADA SÜZ 9 5 7,33 7 3 6,00 11 4 9,66 7 2 6,33 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 47 21 39,98 108,950 70

00395 SALTUK BUĞRA BÜYÜKTO 7 7 4,66 8 3 7,00 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 48 22 40,66 108,640 71

00031 ARİF DORUK BÜTÜN 7 8 4,33 9 6 7,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 50 25 41,65 108,640 72

00028 ARAS SÖNMEZ     5 9 2,00 9 5 7,33 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 51 22 43,65 108,630 73

00228 GÜLDEM ÖZTUZCU 9 4 7,66 7 6 5,00 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 5 2 4,33 48 20 41,31 108,270 74

00175 EMİR EREN YATAR 7 8 4,33 9 6 7,00 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 52 23 44,31 107,280 75

00510 EMEK ARSLANDOĞMUŞ 9 5 7,33 6 5 4,33 11 4 9,66 5 5 3,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 49 21 41,97 105,930 76

00109 DENİZ TUĞRA ÇAM 7 8 4,33 8 7 5,66 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 54 21 46,98 105,930 77

00388 RÜMEYSA SEHER TOZ  A 8 7 5,66 7 8 4,33 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 54 21 46,97 105,920 78

00387 RUÇHAN AY 5 10 1,66 9 6 7,00 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 8 1 7,66 9 1 8,66 53 21 45,98 104,960 79

00244 HİLAL EVRAN 6 8 3,33 8 4 6,66 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 4 5 2,33 49 21 41,98 104,950 80

00144 ELA TAREM TEMUR 7 8 4,33 10 3 9,00 9 5 7,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 50 22 42,65 104,630 81

00427 TAHA EYMEN ARKALI 10 5 8,33 6 9 3,00 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 5 5 3,33 50 25 41,65 104,620 82

00135 EDA HAS 6 8 3,33 9 4 7,66 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 53 19 46,64 104,600 83

00047 AYMİNA ÇULLU 10 3 9,00 4 5 2,33 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 10 0 10,00 5 4 3,66 47 19 40,65 103,620 84

00180 EMRE ATEŞ 8 6 6,00 7 5 5,33 11 4 9,66 5 1 4,66 8 2 7,33 8 1 7,66 47 19 40,64 103,610 85



00302 MEHMET COŞKUN 7 8 4,33 9 5 7,33 11 3 10,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 47 26 38,32 103,300 86

00447 YAVUZ SELİM SUCU 6 9 3,00 8 6 6,00 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 50 24 41,99 101,990 87

00141 EGEMEN ÜRÜYEN 10 5 8,33 7 7 4,66 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 47 27 37,98 101,940 88

00243 HAZAL GEZER 7 7 4,66 6 3 5,00 12 3 11,00 9 0 9,00 9 1 8,66 3 5 1,33 46 19 39,65 101,630 89

00188 ERGÜL ARSLANYÖRÜR 5 8 2,33 10 3 9,00 10 5 8,33 9 0 9,00 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 49 21 41,98 100,960 90

00222 FURKAN UZUNOĞLU 6 8 3,33 4 1 3,66 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 51 13 46,65 100,620 91

00370 ÖMER FARUK UYAR 7 8 4,33 8 5 6,33 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 3 7 0,66 48 25 39,64 100,600 92

00094 ÇAĞAN TÜTÜNCÜ 9 6 7,00 6 8 3,33 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 6 2 5,33 48 24 39,98 99,950 93

00240 HAYAL BELİS ZEYTİN 6 9 3,00 6 6 4,00 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 52 20 45,33 99,330 94

00041 AYAZ KAYAR 6 9 3,00 8 5 6,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 47 26 38,32 99,310 95

00291 KERİM KAVAK      7 8 4,33 8 7 5,66 12 3 11,00 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 46 29 36,31 99,280 96

00464 ZEYNEP ATICI 4 11 0,33 11 4 9,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 49 26 40,30 99,250 97

00446 YAVUZ SELİM GÖKÇE 8 4 6,66 7 7 4,66 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 45 26 36,30 99,240 98

00079 BERKAY İNAN 7 4 5,66 6 4 4,66 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 7 2 6,33 3 1 2,66 43 16 37,63 97,570 99

00097 ÇAĞRI PARAPAN 5 9 2,00 6 7 3,66 14 1 13,66 6 3 5,00 10 0 10,00 6 3 5,00 47 23 39,32 97,280 100

00289 KEREM DURAN 10 5 8,33 8 7 5,66 11 4 9,66 4 6 2,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 33 22 25,65 96,600 101

00119 DURU AKGÜL 6 6 4,00 6 5 4,33 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 8 1 7,66 48 19 41,64 95,610 102

00462 ZELİHA CAN         7 8 4,33 9 6 7,00 9 6 7,00 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 5 5 3,33 49 26 40,32 95,310 103

00129 ECEM SU KAHYA 7 8 4,33 7 8 4,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 3 7 0,66 46 29 36,31 95,290 104

00008 AHMET AYAZ ARKALI 9 5 7,33 5 9 2,00 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 47 26 38,31 95,280 105

00508 TEMMUZ ARSLANDOĞMUŞ 4 11 0,33 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,66 5 5 3,33 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 49 26 40,31 95,270 106

00469 ZEYNEP ECEM ÖZÇELİK 6 9 3,00 11 4 9,66 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,66 49 26 40,31 95,270 107

00229 GÜLSERİ ELA ÖZTÜRK 5 10 1,66 9 4 7,66 10 5 8,33 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 49 24 40,97 93,920 108

00248 HÜSEYİN ALPER SARIBA 5 10 1,66 9 4 7,66 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 46 27 36,97 93,910 109

00281 KADİR EFE TÜRKDİL 8 5 6,33 8 4 6,66 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 5 2 4,33 45 22 37,64 93,590 110

00067 BELİS SEZER 4 10 0,66 6 3 5,00 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 9 0 9,00 8 1 7,66 49 17 43,32 93,300 111

00360 NİSA NUR DOĞAN 6 8 3,33 10 4 8,66 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 1 3 0,00 41 26 32,31 93,270 112

00139 EGE ÖZKAN 8 7 5,66 4 4 2,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 46 22 38,63 92,570 113

00038 ATAHAN KURT 6 9 3,00 5 5 3,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 7 2 6,33 47 22 39,65 91,640 114

00266 İNCİ ŞENGÜL 6 9 3,00 5 6 3,00 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 48 23 40,32 91,320 115

00394 SAİD EMRE AKMAN 6 9 3,00 8 6 6,00 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 48 26 39,32 91,310 116

00082 BERRA ŞERBETÇİOĞLU 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 46 29 36,32 91,310 117

00417 SÜLEYMAN YİĞİT KAMAL 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 43 32 32,32 91,300 118

00177 EMİR TÜRKOĞLU 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 49 26 40,31 91,280 119

00355 NİLSU RÜMEYSA ÖLMEZ 9 6 7,00 5 10 1,66 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 46 29 36,31 91,270 120

00345 MUSTAFA GÜVERCİN 6 8 3,33 10 4 8,66 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 3 6 1,00 43 29 33,32 90,290 121

00306 MEHMET AFE AILDIZ 5 8 2,33 8 1 7,66 9 5 7,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 45 21 37,98 89,940 122

00107 DENİZ GÜRBÜZ 8 7 5,66 7 7 4,66 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 44 30 33,97 89,920 123

00085 BEYZA UYAR 5 10 1,66 7 4 5,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 47 24 38,97 89,910 124

00176 EMİR SALİH ÖZTÜRK 8 7 5,66 9 5 7,33 6 3 5,00 7 0 7,00 5 0 5,00 6 2 5,33 41 17 35,32 89,290 125

00350 NEBAHAT BETÜL DEMİRC 7 6 5,00 5 6 3,00 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 6 3 5,00 44 24 35,99 88,970 126

00503 AYTEKİN DURAKAN 5 10 1,66 8 7 5,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 8 1 7,66 7 3 6,00 47 27 37,97 88,910 127

00482 ZEYNEP SEZGİN 2 13 -2,33 11 3 10,00 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 3 3 2,00 45 25 36,65 88,640 128

00424 ŞEYMA ÖZZEYBEK 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,66 47 28 37,65 88,620 129

00375 ÖYKÜ DURU KALAYCI 6 9 3,00 7 7 4,66 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 49 25 40,65 88,620 130



00215 FEYZA BALABAN 7 7 4,66 7 5 5,33 9 6 7,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 46 25 37,64 88,610 131

00077 BERİL MİRA SÖNMEZ 7 8 4,33 5 7 2,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,66 47 25 38,64 88,590 132

00045 AYHAN KURŞUN 7 8 4,33 10 3 9,00 9 6 7,00 3 7 0,66 6 4 4,66 3 4 1,66 38 32 27,31 88,300 133

00064 BATUHAN BAYGIN 7 8 4,33 5 4 3,66 9 6 7,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 9 0 9,00 49 19 42,65 87,620 134

00184 EREN GÜLER 6 9 3,00 9 3 8,00 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 43 29 33,33 87,330 135

00480 ZEYNEP ÖZÇAM 9 6 7,00 6 9 3,00 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 46 29 36,32 87,320 136

00160 ELİF REVA CIVLAN 3 12 -1,00 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 46 29 36,31 87,280 137

00172 EMİNE GÜLCE ÇETİN 5 10 1,66 9 6 7,00 11 4 9,66 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 43 32 32,31 87,270 138

00386 REYYAN ALKAN 7 8 4,33 8 7 5,66 10 5 8,33 7 2 6,33 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 42 32 31,31 86,270 139

00001 ABDURRAHMAN SAYLAN 10 5 8,33 7 4 5,66 6 8 3,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 1 4 -0,33 42 23 34,31 86,270 140

00183 EREN DURAN 6 7 3,66 8 6 6,00 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 3 2 2,33 0 0 0,00 35 22 27,65 85,610 141

00142 ELA GÜRKAŞ 3 11 -0,66 9 3 8,00 11 4 9,66 7 2 6,33 8 2 7,33 5 4 3,66 43 26 34,32 85,320 142

00015 AKIN  KEKLİK 6 9 3,00 9 5 7,33 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 43 31 32,66 84,650 143

00451 YİĞİT SAYIN   AA A 6 9 3,00 9 4 7,66 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 2 8 -0,66 42 31 31,66 84,640 144

00416 SÜLEYMAN KOCABAA 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 44 31 33,65 84,620 145

00399 SELEN DALLIK 6 8 3,33 7 5 5,33 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 43 28 33,65 84,620 146

00392 SABRİ AYBERK ATAK 7 8 4,33 7 8 4,33 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 44 31 33,65 84,620 147

00093 CİHAN OĞUZ 6 9 3,00 7 7 4,66 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 46 28 36,65 84,620 148

00260 İDİL SU ENÇETİN 8 5 6,33 6 6 4,00 8 6 6,00 6 3 5,00 9 0 9,00 6 3 5,00 43 23 35,33 84,320 149

00224 GİZEM AKYAR 6 8 3,33 6 5 4,33 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 5 3 4,00 41 27 31,98 83,940 150

00049 AYSİMA AKTAŞ 7 8 4,33 6 8 3,33 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 4 4 2,66 45 27 35,97 83,940 151

00111 DERİN KARHAN 8 6 6,00 4 2 3,33 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 5 4 3,66 42 22 34,65 83,640 152

00181 ENSAR MALGAZ 7 7 4,66 7 5 5,33 9 6 7,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 1 8 -1,66 42 28 32,65 83,620 153

00027 ARAS DENİZ AK 4 11 0,33 8 6 6,00 12 3 11,00 5 5 3,33 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 42 32 31,32 83,310 154

00080 BERKAY KARADEMİR 8 7 5,66 6 9 3,00 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 43 32 32,32 83,290 155

00009 AHMET EMİR KARA 6 9 3,00 4 3 3,00 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 44 23 36,31 83,290 156

00050 AYSİMA ÇELEN 5 10 1,66 8 7 5,66 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 10 0 10,00 4 6 2,00 46 29 36,31 83,260 157

00247 HUZEYFE KARTALMIŞ 7 8 4,33 3 5 1,33 13 2 12,33 6 4 4,66 6 0 6,00 0 0 0,00 35 19 28,65 82,620 158

00073 BEREN SEZER 9 6 7,00 5 6 3,00 8 6 6,00 9 1 8,66 7 2 6,33 5 5 3,33 43 26 34,32 82,320 159

00337 MUHAMMED TALHA YILDI 5 10 1,66 7 4 5,66 10 5 8,33 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 2 7 -0,33 44 26 35,32 82,270 160

00161 ELİF YAŞAR 5 9 2,00 7 6 5,00 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 45 27 35,99 81,980 161

00020 ALİ NAİL EGE PARMAKS 7 8 4,33 6 9 3,00 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 42 33 30,99 81,960 162

00308 MEHAET EGE YAMAN 4 10 0,66 6 3 5,00 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,66 44 24 35,98 81,940 163

00052 AYŞE MELİSA YILMAZ 4 11 0,33 7 7 4,66 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 0 10 -3,33 41 33 29,98 81,940 164

00397 SAYİT UZUN 4 8 1,33 9 4 7,66 8 7 5,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 46 24 37,97 81,920 165

00152 ELİF DURU SAVAŞ 5 10 1,66 7 7 4,66 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 44 30 33,97 81,910 166

00408 SEVDEAKURŞUN 4 11 0,33 8 6 6,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 1 4 -0,33 39 30 28,99 80,980 167

00381 POLAT DUMAN 5 8 2,33 8 3 7,00 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 7 2 6,33 4 6 2,00 41 27 31,99 80,980 168

00309 MEHMET EMİN AZER 5 9 2,00 4 8 1,33 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 7 2 6,33 46 24 37,99 80,980 169

00091 CEYLİN DEVRİM 7 8 4,33 6 5 4,33 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 8 1 7,66 46 24 37,97 80,930 170

00007 AGAH RAMİZ ÇAKIR 4 11 0,33 10 5 8,33 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 44 31 33,65 80,630 171

00433 TUĞBA KABASAKAL 8 5 6,33 3 10 -0,33 10 5 8,33 8 1 7,66 9 1 8,66 7 2 6,33 45 24 36,98 79,970 172

00444 YAKUP DORUK KANIK 5 9 2,00 2 1 1,66 14 1 13,66 7 3 6,00 3 2 2,33 4 5 2,33 35 21 27,98 79,940 173

00326 MİNA GENÇER A 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 43 32 32,32 79,300 174

00455 YUSAFACAYLAN A 4 11 0,33 8 7 5,66 12 3 11,00 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 40 35 28,31 79,280 175



00314 MELİKE SENA DEMİRHAN 6 8 3,33 8 2 7,33 7 6 5,00 7 3 6,00 8 0 8,00 3 4 1,66 39 23 31,32 78,300 176

00504 HASAN KAAN SİVKA 7 5 5,33 4 3 3,00 10 5 8,33 4 4 2,66 6 4 4,66 5 2 4,33 36 23 28,31 78,290 177

00373 ÖYKÜ ADA TAŞ 8 7 5,66 6 9 3,00 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 39 36 26,98 77,950 178

00143 ELA PELİN KESKİN 4 11 0,33 6 6 4,00 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 45 27 35,98 77,950 179

00100 ÇINAR KAAN KÖMÜRCÜ 4 11 0,33 7 8 4,33 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 0 10 -3,33 39 36 26,98 77,950 180

00321 MERVE YÜKSEL 5 9 2,00 4 7 1,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 46 24 37,98 77,940 181

00096 ÇAĞLAR KAMALI 8 7 5,66 8 7 5,66 8 6 6,00 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 38 36 25,98 77,940 182

00074 BEREN VEZİR 7 8 4,33 5 10 1,66 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 45 30 34,98 77,940 183

00227 GÜLCAN BİÇER 5 9 2,00 4 9 1,00 14 1 13,66 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 3 4 1,66 38 31 27,64 77,620 184

00271 İREM SU ÇETİN 5 7 2,66 4 4 2,66 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 6 2 5,33 9 0 9,00 43 19 36,64 77,590 185

00334 MUHAMMED EYMEN KURAL 6 6 4,00 5 3 4,00 9 6 7,00 8 1 7,66 7 1 6,66 4 4 2,66 39 21 31,98 76,980 186

00293 KUZEY ÇITLAK 6 8 3,33 3 6 1,00 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 6 3 5,00 43 24 34,98 76,950 187

00200 EVİNNAZ ORDU 3 11 -0,66 8 6 6,00 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 42 31 31,66 76,660 188

00061 BAHAR COŞKUN 6 9 3,00 6 9 3,00 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 44 31 33,65 76,640 189

00033 ARMİNA BERRU BİLGİN 6 7 3,66 5 3 4,00 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 41 25 32,65 76,630 190

00359 NİSA KIRMIZI 6 8 3,33 7 5 5,33 9 6 7,00 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 40 31 29,64 76,620 191

00117 DORUK GÜNGÖR 6 9 3,00 9 5 7,33 7 8 4,33 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 3 7 0,66 43 31 32,64 76,620 192

00173 EMİR ASAF KARAKAYA 8 7 5,66 7 8 4,33 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 41 34 29,64 76,590 193

00075 BERİL AYASUN 7 8 4,33 3 2 2,33 10 5 8,33 5 1 4,66 8 1 7,66 5 3 4,00 38 20 31,31 76,280 194

00155 ELİF GÖNEL 6 8 3,33 5 5 3,33 9 4 7,66 9 1 8,66 7 1 6,66 5 4 3,66 41 23 33,30 76,260 195

00206 EYMEN YALÇIN 5 9 2,00 4 5 2,33 12 3 11,00 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 3 6 1,00 39 28 29,65 75,640 196

00459 YUŞA MERT CÖMERT 3 12 -1,00 10 5 8,33 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 43 32 32,32 75,310 197

00196 ESMA BULUT 7 8 4,33 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 46 29 36,32 75,290 198

00471 ZEYNEP İNCİ SAKALLI 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 43 32 32,31 75,270 199

00422 ŞEVKİ EGE KARCI 4 11 0,33 10 5 8,33 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 43 32 32,31 75,270 200

00250 HÜSEYİN POLAT TAŞDAN 7 7 4,66 5 4 3,66 9 6 7,00 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 1 7 -1,33 38 28 28,65 74,610 201

00157 ELİF MİRA SEV 6 9 3,00 7 5 5,33 9 5 7,33 7 1 6,66 8 2 7,33 0 7 -2,33 37 29 27,32 74,300 202

00203 EYLÜL YALÇINTAŞ 4 8 1,33 7 2 6,33 8 6 6,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 41 24 32,98 73,960 203

00191 ERVA SONGÜL KESKİNSO 7 8 4,33 4 8 1,33 10 5 8,33 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 2 8 -0,66 42 30 31,99 73,960 204

00217 FURKAN ADALI 4 7 1,66 7 3 6,00 9 5 7,33 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 2 4 0,66 37 24 28,97 73,940 205

00179 EMİRHAN KIZILTAN 4 11 0,33 7 7 4,66 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 44 30 33,97 73,930 206

00403 SENA KURNAZ 9 5 7,33 4 10 0,66 8 7 5,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 43 30 32,97 73,920 207

00409 SEYİT MERDİM A 5 8 2,33 7 3 6,00 9 6 7,00 0 0 0,00 9 1 8,66 4 2 3,33 34 20 27,32 73,310 208

00299 MAVİ MİRA ASLAN 3 11 -0,66 6 5 4,33 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 7 2 6,33 42 27 32,99 72,980 209

00265 İLYAS DEMİR 5 7 2,66 5 5 3,33 10 4 8,66 8 2 7,33 5 3 4,00 4 3 3,00 37 24 28,98 72,930 210

00065 BELGİN ELA ŞENGÜL 6 9 3,00 3 12 -1,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 44 31 33,65 72,650 211

00171 EMİN KARA 6 9 3,00 4 11 0,33 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 41 34 29,65 72,640 212

00103 ÇİSEM DURU BOZ 5 9 2,00 9 6 7,00 7 8 4,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 43 31 32,65 72,640 213

00312 MEHMET ENES AKINALP 3 12 -1,00 11 4 9,66 8 7 5,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 1 9 -2,00 41 34 29,64 72,600 214

00024 ALPEREN ULU 5 10 1,66 5 5 3,33 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 5 4 3,66 41 28 31,64 71,600 215

00391 RÜZGAR PAŞA DEAİR 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,66 10 0 10,00 2 8 -0,66 40 35 28,33 71,320 216

00255 İBRAHİM ANAFARTA   A 5 8 2,33 6 8 3,33 9 5 7,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 42 29 32,31 71,280 217

00221 FURKAN DERELİ 7 8 4,33 8 7 5,66 7 8 4,33 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 2 8 -0,66 40 35 28,32 71,280 218

00280 İSMAİL TALHA ŞALIŞ 5 10 1,66 4 10 0,66 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 42 32 31,31 71,270 219

00006 ADEM YAVUZ ÇOBANTEPE 3 10 -0,33 6 8 3,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 2 8 -0,66 39 33 28,00 70,000 220



00333 MUHAMMED EMİR ALIŞMA 7 8 4,33 6 9 3,00 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 2 8 -0,66 39 36 26,99 69,980 221

00225 GİZEM HAYTA 3 10 -0,33 7 5 5,33 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 2 8 -0,66 37 33 26,00 69,980 222

00054 AYŞE ŞURA DEMİRKOL 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 1 9 -2,00 39 36 26,99 69,980 223

00412 SILA ARKALI      5 9 2,00 5 10 1,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 41 33 29,98 69,940 224

00311 MEHMET EMRE GİRGİÇ 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 36 39 22,98 69,930 225

00053 AYŞE NİL AKBABA 5 10 1,66 5 10 1,66 11 4 9,66 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 42 33 30,97 69,910 226

00253 IRMAK ERDOĞAN 5 9 2,00 8 3 7,00 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 42 28 32,65 68,650 227

00134 EDA ÇAKIR 5 10 1,66 7 7 4,66 9 6 7,00 4 6 2,00 10 0 10,00 5 5 3,33 40 34 28,65 68,610 228

00435 TUNAAANAÖNER 3 10 -0,33 6 4 4,66 9 6 7,00 8 1 7,66 8 1 7,66 8 2 7,33 42 24 33,98 67,970 229

00023 ALPEREN KARACAN 6 5 4,33 2 3 1,00 11 4 9,66 6 3 5,00 6 4 4,66 0 6 -2,00 31 25 22,65 67,620 230

00153 ELİF ER 6 9 3,00 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 43 32 32,32 67,300 231

00026 AMİBE GÜLTEKİN 4 11 0,33 9 6 7,00 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 37 38 24,31 67,300 232

00483 ZEYNEP SOYKÖK 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 11 4 9,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 40 35 28,32 67,290 233

00234 HALİDE ERGÜLEÇ 8 4 6,66 0 7 -2,33 11 4 9,66 4 3 3,00 8 1 7,66 1 1 0,66 32 20 25,31 67,280 234

00278 İSMAİL ÇINAR ÖZBEK 5 10 1,66 5 10 1,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 40 35 28,31 67,250 235

00003 ABIDIN TURKHAY 6 9 3,00 6 9 3,00 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 39 36 26,99 65,990 236

00264 İLKNUR ŞİMŞEK 6 9 3,00 7 5 5,33 8 6 6,00 9 1 8,66 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 30 21 22,99 65,980 237

00083 BEYAZIT DÖNER 3 11 -0,66 8 7 5,66 9 4 7,66 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 3 7 0,66 39 33 27,98 65,960 238

00340 MUHAMMET EMİR ÜNLÜ 4 11 0,33 2 4 0,66 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 3 7 0,66 39 27 29,98 65,950 239

00364 ONUR TÜFEKÇİ 6 7 3,66 6 7 3,66 9 6 7,00 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 1 9 -2,00 35 36 22,98 65,940 240

0050 KUZEY ARAS GÜNBATI 7 8 4,33 4 9 1,00 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 7 2 6,33 2 6 0,00 36 34 24,65 65,630 241

00463 ZELİHA SU ÇOBAN 4 9 1,00 5 7 2,66 10 5 8,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 2 5 0,33 39 28 29,65 65,620 242

00249 HÜSEYİN FURKAN DEMİR 5 7 2,66 5 4 3,66 8 7 5,66 8 1 7,66 9 0 9,00 3 6 1,00 38 25 29,64 65,580 243

00423 ŞEYMA AKALIN 3 11 -0,66 3 7 0,66 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 6 3 5,00 41 27 31,99 64,990 244

00335 MUHAMMED MUSTAFA GÜL 4 11 0,33 6 6 4,00 10 5 8,33 8 1 7,66 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 38 33 26,98 64,960 245

00285 KAZIM ÇAĞLAR KİRİMLİ 2 13 -2,33 6 9 3,00 12 3 11,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 41 34 29,66 64,670 246

00421 ŞEVKET EMİR KAHRAMAN 3 12 -1,00 7 6 5,00 11 4 9,66 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 36 37 23,65 64,630 247

00382 RABİA NAZ ANIŞ 6 8 3,33 3 6 1,00 10 5 8,33 5 4 3,66 8 1 7,66 4 4 2,66 36 28 26,64 64,620 248

00037 ASYA PETRİÇLİ 4 9 1,00 6 8 3,33 9 5 7,33 8 1 7,66 8 1 7,66 4 4 2,66 39 28 29,64 64,620 249

00241 HAYRETTTİN AKBULUT 9 6 7,00 4 11 0,33 8 7 5,66 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 38 37 25,64 64,610 250

00505 ABDULLAH ARAS SİVKA 6 7 3,66 4 8 1,33 9 4 7,66 5 3 4,00 8 2 7,33 4 4 2,66 36 28 26,64 64,590 251

00133 ECRİN KAYA 3 10 -0,33 5 5 3,33 10 5 8,33 8 1 7,66 9 1 8,66 4 4 2,66 39 26 30,31 64,300 252

00013 AHMET YILMAZ 3 12 -1,00 7 6 5,00 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 3 5 1,33 38 33 26,99 63,980 253

00344 MUSTAFA ERAY GİRGİN 6 9 3,00 5 7 2,66 8 7 5,66 8 1 7,66 7 2 6,33 5 2 4,33 39 28 29,64 63,600 254

00327 MİNA NAZ UYAA 8 7 5,66 3 12 -1,00 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 40 35 28,32 63,300 255

00377 ÖYKÜ KORKUTMA 7 8 4,33 6 7 3,66 7 8 4,33 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 38 35 26,31 63,270 256

00088 BUĞLEM NUR KAHRAMAN 6 6 4,00 5 5 3,33 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 4 3 3,00 37 27 27,99 62,970 257

00197 ESMA NİL TURUNÇEL 5 10 1,66 8 5 6,33 9 6 7,00 4 3 3,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 26 24 17,99 62,960 258

00131 ECRİN BEYGİ 5 8 2,33 3 6 1,00 9 6 7,00 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 5 4 3,66 40 26 31,32 62,310 259

00245 HİMMET ENES KARAHAN 5 9 2,00 2 10 -1,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 38 33 26,99 62,000 260

00213 FATMA BEREN TÜRKBAY 5 10 1,66 4 9 1,00 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 40 33 28,98 61,950 261

00178 EMİRCAN ÇABUK 4 11 0,33 8 7 5,66 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 3 7 0,66 39 36 26,97 61,920 262

00011 AHMET FURKAN ÖZDEMİR 4 11 0,33 8 7 5,66 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 39 36 26,97 61,920 263

00170 EMİN EFE ÖZDEMİR 6 9 3,00 3 6 1,00 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 3 5 1,33 38 29 28,32 61,320 264

00136 EDA YÜKSEL       4 11 0,33 5 8 2,33 9 6 7,00 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 42 31 31,65 60,630 265



00336 MUHAMMED TALHA DEMİR 4 11 0,33 6 7 3,66 9 6 7,00 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 1 5 -0,66 38 31 27,65 60,620 266

00237 HASANALP ÖZBUDAK 6 9 3,00 6 9 3,00 8 6 6,00 6 3 5,00 6 3 5,00 3 4 1,66 35 34 23,66 59,660 267

00022 ALPEREN AKTAN 3 11 -0,66 7 5 5,33 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 39 32 28,32 59,310 268

00449 YİĞİT EREN TIRAŞ 4 11 0,33 5 10 1,66 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 40 35 28,31 59,270 269

00098 ÇINAR ERHAN ÖVER 6 6 4,00 5 7 2,66 8 7 5,66 6 3 5,00 6 3 5,00 2 7 -0,33 33 33 21,99 58,950 270

00407 SEVDE ARAL 7 8 4,33 3 4 1,66 10 4 8,66 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 20 16 14,65 58,600 271

00235 HALİL YASİR ATAÇAKIR 4 10 0,66 5 7 2,66 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 7 1 6,66 0 7 -2,33 34 32 23,31 58,260 272

00470 ZEYNEP EYLÜL YILMAZ 3 11 -0,66 6 5 4,33 9 6 7,00 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 37 33 25,99 58,000 273

00051 AYSİMA KÖROĞLU 3 9 0,00 3 9 0,00 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 2 8 -0,66 36 33 25,00 58,000 274

00190 ERVA KÜLAHLI 3 10 -0,33 5 6 3,00 9 5 7,33 9 0 9,00 8 1 7,66 3 5 1,33 37 27 27,99 57,990 275

00256 İBRAHİM BUĞRA TUFAN 4 10 0,66 5 6 3,00 11 4 9,66 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 31 39 17,99 57,950 276

00163 ELİF ZEYNEP ESASPEHLİVAN 2 13 -2,33 7 8 4,33 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 39 36 27,00 57,980 277

00474 ZEYNEP KEMER 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 39 36 26,97 57,930 278

00413 SUDEBERAN BUYACI 3 12 -1,00 7 8 4,33 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 38 37 25,65 56,640 279

00087 BİRSU ÖVER 6 7 3,66 3 12 -1,00 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 36 37 23,65 56,620 280

00226 GÖKSU YILDIRIM 5 8 2,33 6 4 4,66 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 1 9 -2,00 34 34 22,65 56,610 281

00376 ÖYKÜ HELVA 5 10 1,66 6 7 3,66 8 6 6,00 6 1 5,66 5 3 4,00 3 4 1,66 33 31 22,64 56,600 282

00102 ÇINAREGE TÜRKOĞLU 4 11 0,33 6 7 3,66 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 39 34 27,64 56,590 283

00046 AYKUT GEÇKİN 3 12 -1,00 11 3 10,00 4 5 2,33 7 2 6,33 7 2 6,33 1 9 -2,00 33 33 21,99 55,980 284

00343 MUSTAFA EFE TUNCER 5 10 1,66 4 9 1,00 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 38 35 26,32 55,300 285

00071 BEREN ÖZDEMİR 3 10 -0,33 6 7 3,66 8 6 6,00 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 38 32 27,31 55,300 286

00123 DÜRİYE NAZ KARA 4 11 0,33 7 8 4,33 7 8 4,33 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,66 3 7 0,66 40 35 28,31 55,280 287

00236 HAMZA SOYSAL 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 9 1 8,66 9 1 8,66 0 10 -3,33 37 38 24,31 55,270 288

00018 ALİ İNANÇ KARADEVECİ 4 11 0,33 5 10 1,66 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 3 7 0,66 37 38 24,30 55,260 289

00410 SEYMEN ARDA CENGİZ 5 10 1,66 7 7 4,66 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 33 41 19,30 55,240 290

00330 MİRAÇ GÜNDÜZ 5 10 1,66 7 7 4,66 8 7 5,66 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 33 41 19,30 55,240 291

00167 ELVİN GERÇEL 2 8 -0,66 6 3 5,00 8 6 6,00 6 2 5,33 7 1 6,66 3 4 1,66 32 24 23,99 55,010 292

00089 CAN SÖKEROĞLU 7 8 4,33 4 7 1,66 8 6 6,00 8 2 7,33 0 0 0,00 2 8 -0,66 29 31 18,66 54,630 293

00341 MUHAMMET LÜTFİ ÜRÜYE 5 8 2,33 2 10 -1,33 10 4 8,66 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 4 5 2,33 36 32 25,32 54,300 294

00185 EREN PALA 4 9 1,00 2 9 -1,00 11 4 9,66 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 2 7 -0,33 36 32 25,32 54,300 295

00365 ORHAN TABUR 7 8 4,33 4 10 0,66 9 6 7,00 5 5 3,33 4 5 2,33 3 7 0,66 32 41 18,31 54,280 296

00366 OSMAN TUĞRAAEREKEN 2 13 -2,33 1 2 0,33 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 4 6 2,00 36 27 26,99 53,990 297

00485 ZÜMRA MERYEM AKTAŞ 3 10 -0,33 6 7 3,66 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 35 36 22,99 53,980 298

00404 SERAP ÇOBANOĞLU 4 9 1,00 4 8 1,33 9 6 7,00 7 1 6,66 8 2 7,33 4 4 2,66 36 30 25,98 53,970 299

00486 ZÜMRANAZ KAPANCI 7 8 4,33 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 2 8 -0,66 36 39 22,99 53,950 300

00048 AYMİNA SAVAŞ 1 13 -3,33 8 7 5,66 10 4 8,66 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 34 39 20,98 53,950 301

00507 MUSTAFA ÇINAR GÜLBAH 3 11 -0,66 7 8 4,33 11 4 9,66 1 2 0,33 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 22 25 13,66 53,650 302

00036 ASİL ERGUN 5 9 2,00 4 6 2,00 8 6 6,00 6 2 5,33 7 2 6,33 3 5 1,33 33 30 22,99 52,990 303

00329 MİRAÇ FERHATOALA 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 35 40 21,65 52,640 304

00122 DURU YAYLA 3 12 -1,00 5 6 3,00 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 40 31 29,65 52,630 305

00040 AYAZ ATAK 6 9 3,00 5 8 2,33 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 2 7 -0,33 5 5 3,33 32 40 18,65 51,620 306

00279 İSMAİL ÖZEL 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 2 7 -0,33 34 40 20,65 51,610 307

00460 ZAFER EREN   AA 2 12 -2,00 10 3 9,00 6 9 3,00 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 34 38 21,33 51,330 308

00361 NİSA NUR ERKAT 5 9 2,00 2 5 0,33 9 6 7,00 7 2 6,33 7 3 6,00 3 4 1,66 33 29 23,32 51,310 309

00400 SELENAY SERDAR   A 5 9 2,00 5 9 2,00 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 35 38 22,31 51,290 310



00106 DENİZ ADA ERÇAKIR 5 10 1,66 3 10 -0,33 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 35 38 22,31 51,290 311

00151 ELİF DURU ÖNER 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 34 41 20,32 51,280 312

00151 ELİF DURU ÖNER 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 34 41 20,32 51,280 313

00205 EYMEN VEYSEL ÇELİKCA 3 10 -0,33 4 6 2,00 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 3 5 1,33 35 31 24,66 50,670 314

00369 ÖMER FARUK ÇELİM 2 11 -1,66 5 1 4,66 8 4 6,66 6 1 5,66 6 1 5,66 1 4 -0,33 28 22 20,65 49,630 315

00443 YAĞMUR KALABAK 1 12 -3,00 6 5 4,33 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 3 2 2,33 4 6 2,00 31 33 19,99 48,970 316

00457 YUSUF EGE TOPAL 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 2 8 -0,66 35 40 21,66 48,630 317

00468 ZEYNEP DURAN     A 3 10 -0,33 3 7 0,66 11 4 9,66 8 2 7,33 4 5 2,33 0 4 -1,33 29 32 18,32 48,290 318

00296 LİVANUR ZEYBEK 5 10 1,66 6 7 3,66 6 9 3,00 9 1 8,66 6 3 5,00 3 7 0,66 35 37 22,64 47,600 319

00012 AHMET TALHA DEMİR 3 12 -1,00 7 8 4,33 7 8 4,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 3 7 0,66 37 38 24,31 47,290 320

00078 BERİL SU ÇAĞLAYAN 2 11 -1,66 5 9 2,00 10 5 8,33 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 4 5 2,33 33 38 20,33 46,340 321

00405 SERKAN KAYA 5 8 2,33 4 7 1,66 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 4 5 2,33 3 3 2,00 29 35 17,31 46,260 322

00307 MEHMET EGE BARAK 3 11 -0,66 4 5 2,33 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 1 9 -2,00 32 36 20,00 46,010 323

00084 BEYAZIT EFE PARMAKAI 6 9 3,00 2 13 -2,33 8 7 5,66 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 39 36 26,99 45,980 324

00371 ÖMER GÜL   5 9 2,00 5 10 1,66 9 6 7,00 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 3 7 0,66 29 45 13,98 45,960 325

00310 MEHMET EMİN YILMAZ 7 8 4,33 3 12 -1,00 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 3 7 0,66 36 39 22,98 45,960 326

00305 MEHMET EFE TURGUT 3 10 -0,33 4 8 1,33 8 7 5,66 8 1 7,66 7 2 6,33 6 2 5,33 36 30 25,98 45,960 327

00058 AZRA NİL KAYA 5 10 1,66 2 10 -1,33 8 5 6,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 37 33 25,98 45,960 328

00201 EYLÜL MERVE MANDACIO 7 7 4,66 2 9 -1,00 6 9 3,00 8 1 7,66 8 2 7,33 5 4 3,66 36 32 25,31 45,290 329

00019 ALİ MERT DOĞAN 4 11 0,33 6 7 3,66 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 0 9 -3,00 33 39 19,98 44,940 330

00481 ZEYNEP ÖZTÜRK 3 11 -0,66 3 11 -0,66 11 4 9,66 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 2 8 -0,66 33 40 19,67 44,690 331

00415 SÜHEYLA SUDE ÇEKER 6 9 3,00 4 11 0,33 7 8 4,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 35 40 21,65 44,630 332

00220 FURKAN CÖMERT 3 12 -1,00 7 8 4,33 7 8 4,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 35 40 21,65 44,630 333

00479 ZEYNEP NUR UYAR 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 32 43 17,64 44,610 334

00233 HAKTAN YAKAR 4 7 1,66 3 3 2,00 7 7 4,66 5 3 4,00 6 1 5,66 2 4 0,66 27 25 18,64 43,600 335

00276 İSMAİL AYAZ 3 10 -0,33 3 6 1,00 9 6 7,00 8 2 7,33 7 2 6,33 0 3 -1,00 30 29 20,33 43,340 336

00300 MEDİNE BÖLÜM 3 12 -1,00 7 6 5,00 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 2 8 -0,66 32 41 18,33 43,320 337

00125 ECE DENİZ KARTAL 6 9 3,00 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 0 10 -3,33 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 28 47 12,33 43,320 338

00165 ELİFSU ÇETİNER 3 12 -1,00 6 6 4,00 7 8 4,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 34 38 21,32 43,310 339

00039 ATİLLA AKYAR 5 9 2,00 4 11 0,33 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 2 8 -0,66 33 41 19,33 43,300 340

00035 ASEL SARIÇAYIR 3 12 -1,00 5 10 1,66 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 1 9 -2,00 31 44 16,31 43,280 341

00208 EZGİ  IRAZ  EJDAR 3 11 -0,66 3 4 1,66 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 2 7 -0,33 33 32 22,32 42,300 342

00076 BERİL KARABIYIK 5 6 3,00 5 4 3,66 4 9 1,00 7 1 6,66 5 1 4,66 2 5 0,33 28 26 19,31 42,290 343

00154 ELİF EROL 2 13 -2,33 6 3 5,00 7 8 4,33 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 33 36 20,98 41,980 344

00214 FATMA BETÜL MANDIR 3 12 -1,00 7 8 4,33 6 9 3,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 36 39 22,98 41,970 345

00216 FEYZANUR SANSAR 7 6 5,00 3 8 0,33 7 8 4,33 5 4 3,66 2 7 -0,33 2 7 -0,33 26 40 12,66 41,640 346

00166 ELİZ KAYALI 4 10 0,66 0 6 -2,00 11 4 9,66 5 4 3,66 5 3 4,00 2 4 0,66 27 31 16,64 41,600 347

00456 YUAAFADAAAI 3 12 -1,00 3 11 -0,66 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 34 40 20,66 40,670 348

00072 BEREN PAYDAŞ 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 35 40 21,65 40,610 349

00262 İLKE ELVİN DEMİR 4 11 0,33 5 7 2,66 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 32 40 18,64 40,600 350

00420 ŞAHİN YENİGÜN 5 10 1,66 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 32 43 17,64 40,590 351

00349 MUSTAFA YILDIRIM 4 8 1,33 4 4 2,66 5 10 1,66 8 1 7,66 7 3 6,00 5 2 4,33 33 28 23,64 40,590 352

00367 ÖMER ASAF UYAR 4 6 2,00 1 7 -1,33 6 6 4,00 9 0 9,00 5 2 4,33 8 0 8,00 33 21 26,00 40,010 353

00436 UMUT KARAKUŞ 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,66 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 31 44 16,31 39,290 354

00169 EMİN DEVCAR 2 12 -2,00 5 8 2,33 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 34 38 21,31 39,280 355



00090 CENNET AKINALP AAA A 3 10 -0,33 4 7 1,66 7 5 5,33 5 4 3,66 6 3 5,00 5 5 3,33 30 34 18,65 38,630 356

00199 ESRA ŞEYMA KAÇAN 4 10 0,66 3 7 0,66 9 6 7,00 4 6 2,00 6 3 5,00 1 9 -2,00 27 41 13,32 38,280 357

00251 HÜSNA DEMİRCİ 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 30 45 14,99 37,970 358

00383 RAFİ BALAL VURAL 2 13 -2,33 5 10 1,66 10 5 8,33 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 30 45 14,98 37,960 359

00379 ÖZGE KÖSE 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 4 6 2,00 22 33 10,99 37,960 360

00092 CEYLİN GÖKTAŞ 6 9 3,00 3 10 -0,33 6 9 3,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 33 40 19,66 36,670 361

00258 İBRAHİM EYMEN GÖÇAN 3 11 -0,66 5 5 3,33 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 29 40 15,66 36,660 362

00438 VERA NUR AVCI 3 12 -1,00 3 9 0,00 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 35 37 22,65 36,630 363

00150 ELİF ÇALIŞKAN 5 10 1,66 5 7 2,66 4 11 0,33 9 1 8,66 8 2 7,33 4 6 2,00 35 37 22,64 36,590 364

00148 ELİF ATEŞ      5 10 1,66 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 29 46 13,64 36,590 365

00182 ERDEM EFE AKIN 6 9 3,00 2 4 0,66 4 6 2,00 7 0 7,00 6 2 5,33 2 2 1,33 27 23 19,32 36,300 366

00331 MİRAÇ VURAL 2 13 -2,33 6 7 3,66 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 6 2 5,33 32 39 18,98 35,960 367

00275 İSA EREN SEÇGİN 5 10 1,66 1 12 -3,00 10 5 8,33 5 5 3,33 3 5 1,33 5 5 3,33 29 42 14,98 35,950 368

00042 AYAZ YILDIRIM 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 6 9 3,00 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 31 44 16,32 35,310 369

00440 YAĞIZ EGE YAVAŞ 5 10 1,66 2 9 -1,00 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 30 41 16,32 35,280 370

00257 İBRAHİM EMRE MERĞENC 4 5 2,33 3 5 1,33 5 5 3,33 3 3 2,00 5 1 4,66 2 4 0,66 22 23 14,31 35,280 371

00274 İREMSU YILDIRIM 5 8 2,33 3 1 2,66 2 3 1,00 4 0 4,00 8 1 7,66 1 6 -1,00 23 19 16,65 34,620 372

00317 MELİSA ÖZDEMİR 3 11 -0,66 3 12 -1,00 9 5 7,33 9 1 8,66 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 31 42 17,00 34,010 373

00384 RALE ÖLAÜM 3 12 -1,00 4 5 2,33 7 8 4,33 8 2 7,33 5 4 3,66 1 5 -0,66 28 36 15,99 32,970 374

00385 BAMAZAN GÖNÜLLÜ 1 12 -3,00 6 5 4,33 8 7 5,66 6 3 5,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 21 27 11,99 32,960 375

00396 SAMET KAYA 6 8 3,33 2 11 -1,66 8 7 5,66 2 8 -0,66 2 8 -0,66 6 4 4,66 26 46 10,67 32,660 376

00372 ÖMER PEYNİRCİOĞLU 3 12 -1,00 4 11 0,33 8 7 5,66 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 32 43 17,64 32,610 377

00223 GAYE ÜLKÜ HOCAOĞLU 4 11 0,33 3 11 -0,66 8 7 5,66 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 30 44 15,32 31,310 378

00239 HATİCE NUR GÜLENÇ 4 9 1,00 3 12 -1,00 8 7 5,66 6 4 4,66 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 29 44 14,32 31,300 379

00390 RÜZGAR EFE YETAÜN 4 11 0,33 2 10 -1,33 7 8 4,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,66 3 4 1,66 33 36 20,98 30,970 380

00164 ELİF ZÜMRA AYDOĞAN 2 11 -1,66 5 9 2,00 8 7 5,66 4 6 2,00 5 4 3,66 3 6 1,00 27 43 12,66 30,660 381

00242 HAYRUNNİSA GEÇKİN 0 5 -1,66 3 1 2,66 6 4 4,66 4 0 4,00 5 0 5,00 0 3 -1,00 18 13 13,66 30,640 382

00466 ZEYNEP BERRA UAAR 7 8 4,33 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 1 9 -2,00 30 45 14,99 29,960 383

00461 ZEHRA KARAKAYA 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,66 10 0 10,00 3 7 0,66 33 42 18,98 29,960 384

00452 YİĞİT ŞEN 3 7 0,66 5 8 2,33 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 1 9 -2,00 23 45 7,99 29,950 385

00477 ZEYNEP MİRA YALÇİNKA 6 5 4,33 3 0 3,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 9 5 7,33 29,320 386

00263 İLKİM BELİS AYTUĞ 4 10 0,66 1 9 -2,00 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 8 1 7,66 3 6 1,00 29 38 16,31 29,270 387

00315 MELİS DEMİR 3 12 -1,00 5 6 3,00 5 10 1,66 6 4 4,66 9 1 8,66 3 6 1,00 31 39 17,98 28,960 388

00194 ESLEM EREN 4 11 0,33 2 10 -1,33 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 29 43 14,65 28,630 389

00017 ALİ DENİZ BAŞKURT 5 10 1,66 3 12 -1,00 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 29 46 13,65 28,620 390

00506 HİLAL KARAKAYA 3 12 -1,00 5 9 2,00 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,66 6 3 5,00 0 9 -3,00 27 45 11,99 27,980 391

00145 ELANUR UZUN 3 11 -0,66 3 11 -0,66 8 7 5,66 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 28 45 12,99 26,010 392

00174 EMİR DANIŞ 6 9 3,00 5 10 1,66 6 9 3,00 1 9 -2,00 1 9 -2,00 2 8 -0,66 21 54 3,00 25,980 393

00484 ZEYNEP SUDE ARIKAA 3 12 -1,00 4 11 0,33 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,66 8 2 7,33 2 8 -0,66 30 45 14,99 25,970 394

00476 ZEYNEP LEBLEBİCİ 5 10 1,66 5 10 1,66 4 11 0,33 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 30 45 14,97 25,920 395

00246 HİRANUR GÜLCE 1 12 -3,00 1 4 -0,33 7 8 4,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,66 7 3 6,00 32 31 21,66 24,660 396

00063 BASRİ DİNÇER 7 8 4,33 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 2 8 -0,66 26 49 9,66 24,630 397

00138 EFECAN KAYNAK 4 8 1,33 5 5 3,33 2 2 1,33 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 11 15 5,99 23,960 398

00002 ABDÜLKADİR GEYLANİ Ş 3 12 -1,00 1 10 -2,33 8 6 6,00 9 1 8,66 6 4 4,66 2 7 -0,33 29 40 15,66 23,670 399

00298 MASAL KÖK 2 12 -2,00 5 9 2,00 6 9 3,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,66 2 8 -0,66 29 44 14,33 23,330 400



00105 DEFNE KAPLAN 4 11 0,33 6 8 3,33 5 10 1,66 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 1 9 -2,00 24 50 7,32 23,280 401

00069 BEREN ARSLAN 3 11 -0,66 5 6 3,00 4 11 0,33 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 2 7 -0,33 28 41 14,34 22,350 402

00475 ZEYNEP KURŞUN 4 11 0,33 3 5 1,33 5 10 1,66 7 3 6,00 5 4 3,66 2 8 -0,66 26 41 12,32 22,280 403

00295 KUZEY KURT 3 12 -1,00 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 1 9 -2,00 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 24 51 6,98 21,950 404

00318 MERT DİNLERA 1 5 -0,66 1 4 -0,33 7 4 5,66 4 2 3,33 0 2 -0,66 2 5 0,33 15 22 7,67 21,680 405

00238 HATİCE FERİHA DEMİRT 3 12 -1,00 6 9 3,00 6 9 3,00 4 6 2,00 2 8 -0,66 2 8 -0,66 23 52 5,68 20,680 406

00316 MELİSA KOÇ 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 26 49 9,65 20,630 407

00437 UMUT KUTUN 4 8 1,33 3 10 -0,33 6 8 3,33 4 5 2,33 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 17 31 6,66 19,650 408

00389 RÜYA AKBAŞA 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 3 12 -1,00 6 3 5,00 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 28 46 12,65 19,640 409

00130 ECENUR GİRİTLİ 5 10 1,66 2 12 -2,00 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 1 7 -1,33 23 49 6,65 18,620 410

00029 ARDA ÇINAR 3 12 -1,00 4 11 0,33 5 10 1,66 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 4 5 2,33 29 45 13,98 16,950 411

00060 BAHADIR EYMEN YANIKO 3 12 -1,00 5 9 2,00 5 10 1,66 8 2 7,33 3 7 0,66 1 9 -2,00 25 49 8,65 16,630 412

00288 KEREM AYGÜN 2 12 -2,00 5 10 1,66 5 10 1,66 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 2 8 -0,66 27 47 11,32 15,280 413

00419 SÜMEYYE YANMAZ 1 14 -3,66 5 10 1,66 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 1 9 -2,00 24 51 6,99 13,980 414

00454 YUSUF AKCAY 5 6 3,00 0 3 -1,00 4 9 1,00 5 5 3,33 0 0 0,00 1 8 -1,66 15 31 4,67 13,670 415

00284 KAYRA SERT A 2 12 -2,00 3 10 -0,33 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,66 4 5 2,33 0 6 -2,00 22 45 6,99 12,990 416

00211 FARUK GÜNAYDIN 4 9 1,00 1 2 0,33 2 5 0,33 5 2 4,33 3 3 2,00 0 0 0,00 15 21 7,99 12,970 417

00358 NİSA GÜR   5 10 1,66 2 13 -2,33 5 9 2,00 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 0 10 -3,33 25 49 8,66 12,650 418

00393 SADIK YAMAN 4 11 0,33 3 1 2,66 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 7 12 2,99 11,960 419

00425 ŞÜKRİYE ECRİNABAKLA 5 10 1,66 2 13 -2,33 4 11 0,33 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 28 47 12,32 11,300 420

00156 ELİF GÜREL 3 12 -1,00 5 10 1,66 4 11 0,33 3 7 0,66 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 24 51 6,98 9,950 421

00294 KUZEY KIRBAÇOĞLU 3 2 2,33 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 3 2 2,33 9,320 422

00439 YAĞIZ ALP KAHYAOĞULL 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 23 52 5,65 8,620 423

00113 DEVRİM DEMİR 5 10 1,66 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 4 6 2,00 2 8 -0,66 1 9 -2,00 20 55 1,66 8,620 424

00402 SEMANUR AYDIN 2 13 -2,33 4 11 0,33 6 9 3,00 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 1 9 -2,00 22 53 4,33 7,330 425

00272 İREM ZÜMRA GÖNÜLTAŞ 3 12 -1,00 3 4 1,66 3 12 -1,00 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 23 44 8,32 7,300 426

00207 EYMEN YUSUF ASLANCI 5 10 1,66 4 10 0,66 4 11 0,33 1 9 -2,00 3 7 0,66 1 9 -2,00 18 56 -0,69 7,260 427

00124 EBRAR REYHAN UZBEK 0 6 -2,00 0 2 -0,66 6 8 3,33 4 2 3,33 2 2 1,33 0 1 -0,33 12 21 5,00 7,010 428

00210 FARUK  ÖZYARANLAR 4 9 1,00 0 8 -2,66 4 11 0,33 5 4 3,66 4 6 2,00 7 1 6,66 24 39 10,99 7,000 429

00270 İREM SANCAR  5 10 1,66 3 8 0,33 3 10 -0,33 2 8 -0,66 3 7 0,66 2 7 -0,33 18 50 1,33 6,310 430

00362 NURSENA TURAN 4 10 0,66 3 11 -0,66 4 11 0,33 6 4 4,66 4 6 2,00 1 9 -2,00 22 51 4,99 5,980 431

00323 METEHAN BAŞKAYA 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 3 12 -1,00 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 2 8 -0,66 24 51 7,00 5,980 432

00283 KAĞAN TOSUN 3 12 -1,00 3 6 1,00 4 11 0,33 5 3 4,00 3 4 1,66 1 6 -1,00 19 42 4,99 5,980 433

00453 YUNUS TUĞAAAAÖAGÜLÜ 2 13 -2,33 4 11 0,33 5 10 1,66 3 7 0,66 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 24 51 6,98 5,960 434

00057 AZRA HAVİN YILDIRIM 5 10 1,66 2 13 -2,33 5 10 1,66 2 8 -0,66 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 21 54 2,99 5,960 435

00467 ZEYNEP ÇAYLAK 0 5 -1,66 1 2 0,33 3 7 0,66 6 1 5,66 2 2 1,33 2 4 0,66 14 21 6,98 4,970 436

00110 DEREN AKKURT 6 9 3,00 3 12 -1,00 1 14 -3,66 6 4 4,66 3 7 0,66 6 4 4,66 25 50 8,32 3,340 437

00086 BİLAL HÜSEYİN İŞLER 8 7 5,66 1 13 -3,33 3 12 -1,00 1 9 -2,00 2 8 -0,66 3 7 0,66 18 56 -0,67 3,320 438

00441 YAĞIZ ÖZGÜVEN 2 11 -1,66 2 12 -2,00 6 9 3,00 5 1 4,66 3 7 0,66 2 8 -0,66 20 48 4,00 2,020 439

00319 MERT EREN GÜNDÜZ 2 10 -1,33 3 8 0,33 3 10 -0,33 3 4 1,66 6 3 5,00 2 5 0,33 19 40 5,66 1,670 440

00411 SEZAİ KÜLAHLI 3 12 -1,00 4 11 0,33 4 10 0,66 3 7 0,66 3 6 1,00 2 8 -0,66 19 54 0,99 0,960 441

00132 ECRİN DALBUDAK 2 13 -2,33 2 10 -1,33 4 11 0,33 10 0 10,00 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,66 25 47 9,33 -0,660 442

00149 ELİF BERRA KORKMAZ 2 13 -2,33 5 9 2,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 7 22 -0,33 -1,320 443

00043 AYBÜKE AYTUĞ 4 11 0,33 4 11 0,33 3 12 -1,00 2 8 -0,66 2 8 -0,66 3 7 0,66 18 57 -1,00 -2,020 444

00259 İDİL ÇAKIR 3 12 -1,00 2 7 -0,33 2 13 -2,33 6 4 4,66 7 3 6,00 2 7 -0,33 22 46 6,67 -4,310 445



00338 MUHAMMET ALİ AAFTÇİ 2 13 -2,33 3 11 -0,66 3 9 0,00 4 4 2,66 4 5 2,33 2 6 0,00 18 48 2,00 -6,970 446

00162 ELİF YILMAZ 4 11 0,33 3 12 -1,00 3 12 -1,00 4 6 2,00 1 9 -2,00 2 8 -0,66 17 58 -2,33 -7,340 447

00450 YİĞİT PAYLAN 1 14 -3,66 5 10 1,66 3 12 -1,00 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 3 7 0,66 20 55 1,65 -7,350 448

00324 METEHAN AKKAYA 1 14 -3,66 3 12 -1,00 4 9 1,00 5 5 3,33 3 5 1,33 3 7 0,66 19 52 1,66 -9,320 449

00357 NİSA GÜL 2 13 -2,33 4 11 0,33 2 13 -2,33 4 5 2,33 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,66 20 54 1,99 -11,000 450

00448 YAZEL GÖK 3 12 -1,00 2 13 -2,33 2 13 -2,33 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 22 53 4,34 -12,640 451

00198 ESMANUR CENGİZ 3 12 -1,00 1 12 -3,00 4 11 0,33 2 8 -0,66 1 9 -2,00 2 7 -0,33 13 59 -6,66 -17,670 452

00418 SÜMEYRANİSA GÜNEYSU 2 13 -2,33 3 10 -0,33 2 13 -2,33 2 8 -0,66 4 6 2,00 1 9 -2,00 14 59 -5,65 -20,620 453


